

COMPARISON LIST
MATERIAL & SERVICE BIDS
2021

INDEX

Page	Title
1	Abrasives for Snow and Ice Control
2	Bituminous Concrete - <i>Extended Bid Prices from 2020</i>
3	Bituminous Materials - Liquid - <i>Extended Bid Prices from 2020</i>
4	Crushed Stone
5	Heavy Rock Rip Rap
6	Highway Aggregates
7	Painting Traffic Lines on Cortland County Highways - <i>Extended Bid Prices from 2020</i>
8	Recycled Asphalt Pavement - <i>Extended Bid Prices from 2020</i>
9	Stone Filling Material
10	Transit Mix Concrete & Precast Blocks
11	ULS Diesel 15PPM Fuel
12	Unleaded Gasoline - Regular/Ethanol (87 Octane)
	Geotextiles - <i>No Bids</i>

ABRASIVES FOR SNOW & ICE CONTROL
(price per ton)

Company	Bid
Cranesville	\$10.75
F.S. Lopke	\$10.50
Fuller's	\$6.00
Hanson Aggregates	\$9.75
Homer S&G	\$9.50
RMS	\$7.25
Suit-Kote	\$9.25
T&C Stone & Gravel	\$4.50

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Cranesville Aggregate Co. 1250 Riverfront Center Amsterdam, NY 12010	Tully	315-408-4449	N/A	Robert VanCoughnett rvancoughnett@cransville.com
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Whitney Point Owego Lounsberry	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Peter E. Fiorini, Jr. pefiorini@fslopke.com
Fullers Excavation, LLC PO Box 182 Cincinnatus, NY 13040	Willet	607-745-6665		Dana Fuller fullersLLC@aol.com
Hanson Aggregates NY LLC P.O. Box A Nedrow, NY 13120	South Onondaga	315-469-3217	315-469-3940	Roger Hutchinson Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com
Homer Sand & Gravel 1865 Route 13 Cortland, NY 13045	Homer	607-745-9624	607-758-6115	Chris Henry ahenry@adhanpiping.com
RMS Gravel Inc. 290 Mott Road PO Box 455 Dryden. NY 13053	Dryden	607-844-8196	607-844-3752	Chris Beckwith rmsg gravel@yahoo.com

BITUMINOUS CONCRETE

(price per ton unless noted)

***Bid Prices Extended from 2020**

Bituminous Material	Suit-Kote *	Hanson	Northern Asphalt
402.3789 37.5 mm Base Course	\$53.85	\$55.50	\$52.50
402.1989 19 mm Binder Course	\$56.75	\$58.75	\$52.50
402.2589 25 mm Binder Course	\$55.25	\$57.60	\$54.00
402.1283 12.5 mm Top Course	\$63.00	\$64.75	\$60.00
402.0983 9.5 mm Top Course	\$65.49	\$69.00	\$61.00
402.0683 6.3 mm Top Course (w/ polymer)	\$74.50	\$73.00	\$72.00
403.15 Type 5 Shim	\$73.75	\$77.00	No Bid
Multi-Grade Modified Asphalt for use in place of Standard asphalt in above conventional HMA items	\$8.00	No Bid	\$7.00
15403.2010 Plant Mixed Stockpile Patching Material	\$83.30	No Bid	No Bid
15403.2020 Cold Mix Stockpile Patching Material	\$79.30	\$90.00	No Bid
15403.2030 Modified Stockpile Patching Material	\$97.50	No Bid	No Bid
405.0101 Type 1 Cold Mix (Fine mix w/ HFMS-2C)	\$53.90	No Bid	No Bid
406.13 Dense Grade Cold-3C Binder	\$53.75	No Bid	No Bid
406.19 7CF Top (High Friction)	\$58.00	No Bid	No Bid
405.0101 Type 2 Cold Mix (open graded) w/ HFMS-2C	\$53.50	No Bid	No Bid
406.13 Dense Graded Cold Mix Type 3C Binder Course	\$51.75	No Bid	No Bid
18403.376	\$63.22	\$55.50	No Bid
18403.256	\$65.67	\$57.60	No Bid
18403.126	\$72.89	\$64.75	No Bid
18403.956	\$74.85	\$69.00	No Bid
Modified Asphalt Hot Sand	\$84.50	No Bid	No Bid
Pretreated Sand	\$42.25	No Bid	No Bid

Equipment / Service	Suit-Kote	Hanson	Northern Asphalt
Paver w/ automated screed & 2 operators	\$3,050.00	No Bid	\$3,700.00
Compaction Roller (w/ operator)	\$1,850.00	No Bid	\$1,600.00
Ten Wheel Dump Truck (per hour)	\$95.00	No Bid	\$95.00
Flow Boy (per hour)	\$125.00	No Bid	\$125.00
Trucking of Materials (per ton/mile)	\$0.40	No Bid	\$0.30

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	Cortlandville	745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
Hanson Aggregates NY LLC PO Box 513 Jamesville, NY 13078	Skaneateles	315-469-5501 315-685-3321	315-469-3133	Roger Hutchinson Roger.Hutchinson@Hanson.com
Northern Asphalt, LLC 6131 East Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Syracuse	315-433-5115	315-458-9684	Richard Riccelli richr@riccellienterprises.com

BITUMINOUS MATERIALS - LIQUID

(price per gal unless noted)

***Bid Prices Extended from 2020**

Bituminous Material	Suit-Kote *	Vestal Asphalt
HFRS-2	\$1.645	\$2.9850
TACK COAT	\$6.250	\$10.0000
HFMS-2	\$2.040	\$3.3540
AEP-M	\$1.550	\$2.2500
AEDC	\$1.500	N/B
AEFC	\$1.450	N/B
HFMS-2ST	\$1.970	\$3.2540
HFMS-2C	N/B	N/B
HFMS-2GH	\$2.390	\$3.2540
HFMS-1	\$1.980	N/B
HFRS-2P	\$2.020	\$3.1550
HFMS-1P	\$2.190	N/B
HFMS-2P	\$2.280	\$3.5540

Equipment (with Operator)	Suit-Kote	Vestal Asphalt
Distributor	No Charge	\$0.035
Roller (W/operator) (per day)	\$1,600.00	\$2,450.000
Pneumatic Roller (W/operator) (Per day)	\$1,475.00	\$2,450.000
Roller (W/O operator) (per day)	\$1,500.00	N/B
Pneumatic Roller (W/O operator) (Per day)	\$1,375.00	N/B
Spreader (per day)	\$1,550.00	\$2,650.000
Flow Boy (per hour)	\$130.00	N/B
Ten Wheel Dump Truck (per hour)	\$110.00	\$200.000

Company	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	(607) 745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
Vestal Asphalt, Inc. 201 Stage Road Vestal, NY 13850	(607) 785-3393	607-785-3396	Steven Edelman contracts@vestalaspalt.com

CRUSHED STONE

(price per ton)

Supplier	#1ST	#1A	#1	#2	#3	#1 & #1A Mix	#1 & #2 Mix
Cranesville	NB	\$15.00	\$13.25	\$12.75	NB	\$14.50	\$13.50
Cortlandville S&G	NB	NB	\$13.00	\$13.00	\$12.00	\$13.50	\$13.00
F.S. Lopke	\$17.00	\$17.00	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$15.00	\$16.00	\$15.00
Fuller's Excavation	\$16.00	\$16.00	\$15.00	\$10.00	\$8.00	\$15.00	\$12.00
Hanson	\$16.00	\$17.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$17.00	\$15.00
RMS	NB	\$13.75	\$13.50	\$12.75	NB	\$13.50	\$13.50
Suit-Kote	\$17.00	\$18.75	\$14.50	\$14.50	NB	\$17.50	\$15.00
Syracuse S&G	NB	\$21.00	\$14.00	\$12.00	\$14.00	\$21.00	\$13.00
T & C Stone	NB	NB	NB	\$14.00	\$10.00	NB	\$14.00
T.H. Kinsella	\$16.50	\$16.50	\$14.95	\$14.95	\$14.95	\$16.50	\$14.95

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Cranesville Aggregate Co. 1250 Riverfront Center Amsterdam, NY 12010	Tully	315-408-4449	N/A	Robert VanCoughnett rvancoughnett@cranesville.com
Cortlandville Sand & Gravel 765 Route 13 Cortland, NY 13045	Cortlandville	607-756-2115	607-758-6115	Chris Henry ahenry@adhanping.com
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Whitney Point Oxford 1A's 1ST's Owego only	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Peter E. Fiorini, Jr. pfiorini@fslopke.com
Fullers Excavation, LLC PO Box 182 Cincinnatus, NY 13040	Willet	607-745-6665		Dana Fuller fullersLLC@aol.com
Hanson Aggregates NY LLC 5126 South Onondaga Rd Nedrow, NY 13120	Jamesville Skaneateles	315-857-7484	315-469-3940	Tony Barletta tony.barletta@lehighhanson.com
RMS Gravel Inc. PO Box 455 Dryden, NY 13053	Dryden	607-844-8197	607-844-3752	Chris Beckwith rmsg gravel@yahoo.com
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	Polkville	607-745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
Syracuse Sand & Gravel 6131 E. Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Stockbridge	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Richard Riccelli richard.riccelli@riccellienterprises.com
T & C Stone & Gravel PO Box 108 Whitney Point, NY 13862	Willet	607-343-6852		Troy Donnelly tcdonn@frontier.net
T. H. Kinsella PO Box 7 Fayetteville, NY 13066	Fayetteville Jamesville	315-637-3390	315-637-1808	Allan Curtis allanecurtis@yahoo.com

HEAVY ROCK RIP-RAP
(price per ton)

F.S. Lopke	Hanson Aggregates	Kinsella	Syracuse S&G
\$43.00	\$43.50	\$57.50	\$41.95

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Oxford, NY Birchardville, PA	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Peter E. Fiorini, Jr. pfiorini@fslopke.com
Hanson Aggregates NY LLC PO Box A Nedrow, NY 13120	Jamesville Skaneateles	315-857-7484	315-469-3940	Tony Barletta tony.barletta@LehighHanson.com
T. H. Kinsella PO Box 7 Fayetteville, NY 13066	Solvay Rd Jamesville	315-637-3390	315-637-1808	Allan Curtis allanecurtis@yahoo.com
Syracuse Sand & Gravel 6131 E. Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Stockbridge	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Richard Riccelli richard.riccelli@riccellienterprises.com

HIGHWAY AGGREGATES

(price per ton)

TITEM No.	203.5	203.7	203.21	304.12	605.1001	610.1403	N/A	N/A	N/A
	SELECT	SELECT	SELECT	SUBBASE COURSE	UNDERDRAIN				1-1/4" Minus
Supplier	BORROW	GRANULAR FILL	STRUCTURE FILL	TYPE 2	FILTER TYPE II	TOPSOIL	Crushed	Screened	Crusher Run
C'ville S&G	\$5.00	\$7.00	\$7.25	\$21.50	\$13.00	NB	\$8.00	\$7.00	\$12.00
Cranesville	\$6.50	\$6.75	\$6.75	NB	NB	NB	\$9.50	\$12.50	\$9.25
Fuller's Excav.	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$18.00	\$7.00	\$5.00	\$9.00
Hanson	NB	\$8.50	\$8.50	\$9.75	\$17.00	NB	\$8.75	NB	\$9.75
Kinsella	\$7.30	\$7.30	\$7.30	\$9.30	\$12.75	\$26.00	\$8.65	\$7.30	\$9.30
RMS	\$4.70	\$7.25	\$7.25	NB	\$13.75	NB	\$7.35	\$7.35	NB
Suit-Kote	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$9.00	\$9.00	\$9.00
Syracuse S&G	\$4.00	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$7.25	\$21.00	\$20.00	\$7.50	\$6.00	\$7.25
F.S. Lopke	\$5.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$7.50	\$16.50	\$26.50	NB	NB	NB
T&C Mobile	\$4.50	\$4.50	\$4.50	\$9.00	\$13.00	\$16.00	\$7.00	\$5.00	\$7.75

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Cortlandville Sand & Gravel 765 Route 13 Cortland, NY 13045	Cortlandville	607-756-2115	607-758-6115	Chris Henry ahenry@adhanpiping.com
Cranesville Aggregate Co. 1250 Riverfront Center Amsterdam, NY 12010	Tully	315-408-4449	N/A	Robert VanCoughnett rvancoughnett@cransville.com
Fullers Excavation, LLC PO Box 182 Cincinnati, NY 13040	Willet	607-745-6665		Dana Fuller fullersLLC@aol.com
Hanson Aggregates NY LLC PO Box A Nedrow, NY 13120	Jamesville Skaneateles South Onondaga	315-587-7484	315-552-5291	Tony Barletta tony.barletta@LehighHanson.com
T.H. Kinsella, Inc. PO Box 7 Fayetteville, NY 13066	Delphi Falls Homer	315-637-3390	315-637-1808	Allan Curtis allanecurtis@yahoo.com
RMS Gravel Inc. PO Box 455 Dryden, NY 13053	Dryden	844-8197	844-3752	Chris Beckwith rmsgravel@yahoo.com
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	Polkville	607-745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
Syracuse Sand & Gravel 6131 E. Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Stockbridge	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Richard Riccelli richard.riccelli@riccellienterprises.com
T&C Mobile Home & Construction Services PO Box 108 Whitney Point, NY 13862	Willet	607-343-6852		Troy Donnelly tcdonn@frontiernet.net
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Oxford, NY Birchardville, PA Windsor, NY	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Peter E. Fiorini, Jr. pfiorini@fslopke.com

PAINTING TRAFFIC LINES ON CORTLAND COUNTY HIGHWAYS

(price per mile unless noted)

* Bid Prices Extended from 2020

Cortland County Highways	Seneca Pavement *	Accent Stripe	O.H.Striping, Inc
Centerline	\$335.00	\$339.00	\$309.00
Edgeline	\$195.00	\$198.00	\$185.00
Stop Bars (each)	\$75.00	\$99.00	\$25.00
Yellow Paint (per gal)			
White Paint (per gal)			
Glass Beads (per lb)			

Centerline Miles = 195 (est.)	\$65,325.00	\$66,105.00	\$60,255.00
Edgeline Miles = 147(est)	\$28,665.00	\$29,106.00	\$27,195.00
Stop Bars=90 est	\$6,750.00	\$8,910.00	\$2,250.00
Total Estimated County Cost	\$100,740.00	\$104,121.00	\$89,700.00

Town & Village Highways	Seneca Pavement	Accent Stripe	O.H.Striping, Inc
Centerline	\$365.00	\$339.00	\$191.00
Edgeline	\$225.00	\$198.00	\$316.00
Yellow Paint (per gal)			
White Paint (per gal)			
Glass Beads (per lb)			

Centerline Miles = 32 (est.)	\$11,680.00	\$10,848.00	\$6,112.00
Edgeline Miles = 23 (est)	\$5,175.00	\$4,554.00	\$7,268.00
Total Est. Town & Vill. Cost	\$16,855.00	\$15,402.00	\$13,380.00

Company	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Seneca Pavement Marking, Inc. 3526 Watkins Road Horseheads, NY 14845	607-742-8072	607-846-3347	Matthew Sena msenecapaving@yahoo.com
Accent Stripe, Inc. 3275 N. Benzing Road Orchard Park, NY 14127	716-823-7704	716-826-2085	Edward Spiesz Eds@Accentstripe.com
O.H. Striping, Inc. 11016 River Road Corning, NY 14830	607-377-9343	607-377-9343	Jeffrey Bly o.h.striping@gmail.com

RECYCLED ASPHALT PAVEMENT

Bid Prices Extended from 2020

	OPTION A	OPTION B	OPTION C
1) Price per Square Yard under 5,000 s.y. (@ 1" to 3" depth)	\$2.120	\$2.700	\$1.950
Price per Square Yard for each additional inch over 3" depth	\$0.270	\$0.210	\$0.150
2) Price per Square Yard under 5,000-10,000 s.y. (@ 1" to 3" depth)	\$1.000	\$2.380	\$0.750
Price per Square Yard for each additional inch over 3" depth	\$0.100	\$0.130	\$0.070
3) Price per Square Yard under 10,000 s.y. (@ 1" to 3" depth)	\$0.920	\$2.260	\$0.590
Price per Square Yard for each additional inch over 3" depth	\$0.060	\$0.050	\$0.050
4) Price per day for Bituminous Paver (Option A only)	\$3,000.00	-----	-----
6) Price per day Ingersol – Rand Model DD-110 compaction roller, or equal (Option A only)	\$2,000.00	-----	-----
6A) Price per day Caterpillar Model PS300B pneumatic tired roller, or equal (Option A only)	\$1,900.00	-----	-----
6B) Price per day for Pugmill (Option A only)	\$2,100.00	-----	-----
7) MS-1 per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.090	\$2.090	\$2.100
8) MS-1P per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.210	\$2.210	\$2.220
9) HFMS-2 per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.150	\$2.150	\$2.200
10) HFMS-2P per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.350	\$2.350	\$2.400
11) HFRA per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.340	\$2.340	\$2.390
12) Calcium Chloride per gallon (Option C only)	-----	-----	\$1.350
12A) Magnesium Chloride Per Gallon (Option C only)	-----	-----	No Bid
13) Maint and Protection of Traffic per day (Option B&C only)	-----	\$0.300	\$0.300
14) Provide and Haul req'd aggregate per ton (Option B&C only)	-----	\$21.000	\$21.000

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	Cortlandville	607-745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

STONE FILLING MATERIALS

(price per ton)

Stone Filling Sizes	F.S. Lopke	Hanson	Kinsella	Syracuse S&G
Heavy	\$35.00	\$36.00	\$37.50	\$34.95
Medium	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$37.50	\$33.95
Light	\$29.00	\$31.50	\$30.00	\$25.95
Fine	\$27.00	\$31.50	\$28.00	\$25.95

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Oxford, NY Birchardville, PA Windsor, NY	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Peter E. Fiorini, Jr. pfiorini@fslopke.com
Hanson Aggregates NY LLC PO Box A Nedrow, NY 13120	Jamesville	315-857-7484	315-857-7484	Tony Barletta tony.barletta@LehighHanson.com
T. H. Kinsella, Inc PO Box 7 Fayetteville, NY 13066	Solvay Rd. Jamesville	315-637-3390	315-637-1808	Allan Curtis allanecurtis@yahoo.com
Syracuse Sand & Gravel 6131 E. Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Stockbridge	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Richard Riccelli richard.riccelli@riccellienterprises.com

TRANSIT MIX CONCRETE & PRECAST CONCRETE BLOCKS

Transit Mix Concrete: (CY unless noted)

Concrete Mix	Cranesville Block	Hanson Aggregate
Class A	\$120.00	\$140.00
Class D	\$128.00	\$150.00
Class E	\$125.00	\$147.00
Class F	\$126.00	\$150.00
Class G	\$126.00	\$150.00
Class H	\$133.00	\$150.00
Class HP	\$161.00	\$185.00
Class DP	\$161.00	\$190.00
3000 PSI Flowable Grout	\$138.00	\$135.00
Additional charge for loads under 4 CY (per load)	\$75.00	\$75.00
Wait Time after 30 min. (per hour)	\$120.00	\$90.00

Precast Concrete Blocks: (EA)

Smooth Top	Cranesville Block	Hanson Aggregate
2'x2'x8'	NB	\$90.00
2'x2'x6'	NB	NB
2'x2'x4'	NB	\$80.00
2'x2'x3'	NB	NB
3'x3'x3' Guide Rail Anchor (County to Supply Hardware)	NB	NB

Keyway Top	Cranesville Block	Hanson Aggregate
2'x2'x8'	NB	NB
2'x2'x6'	\$50.00	NB
2'x2'x4'	NB	NB
2'x2'x3'	NB	NB

Waste Blocks	Cranesville Block	Hanson Aggregate
2'x2'x8'	NB	NB
2'x2'x6'	\$50.00	NB
2'x2'x4'	NB	NB

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Cranesville Aggregate Co. 1250 Riverfront Center Amsterdam, NY 12010	Syracuse	315-408-4449		Robert VanCoughnett rvancoughnett@cransville.com
Hanson Aggregates NY LLC PO Box A Nedrow, NY 13120	Cortland Marcellus Ithaca Nedrow	315-469-3217	315-469-3940	Mike O'Leary mike.o'leary@leighhanson.com John Feyerabend john.feyerabend@leighhanson.com

ULS DIESEL 15PPM FUEL
(price per gallon)

Item	Mirabito	Petroleum Traders Corp.	Buell Fuel LLC
100% ULS Diesel 15 PPM Fuel			
rack price per gallon (Syracuse OPD) 2/1/2020	1.6955	1.6955	1.6955
lust plis oil spill liablility trust fund fees per gallon	0.0010	0.00314	0.00100
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon	0.0249	0.0933	0.0179
TOTAL	\$1.7214	\$1.7919	\$1.7144
ULS Diesel 15PPM Winterized or With Cold Flow Improver			
rack price per gallon (Syracuse OPD) 2/1/2020	1.6955	1.6955	1.6955
lust plis oil spill liablility trust fund fees per gallon	0.0010	0.00314	0.00100
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon	0.0549	0.1133	0.0429
TOTAL	\$1.7514	\$1.8119	\$1.7394
ULS 15PPM Kerosene			
rack price per gallon (Albany OPD) 2/1/2020	1.8292	1.8292	1.8292
lust plis oil spill liablility trust fund fees per gallon	0.0010	0.00314	0.00100
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon	0.0549	0.1633	0.0529
TOTAL	\$1.8851	\$1.9956	\$1.8831

Company	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Mirabito Energy Products The Metro Center 49 Court St. Binghamton NY 13902	607-352-2800	607-352-2822	Joe D'Esti joe.desti@mirabito.com
Petroleum Traders Corporation 7120 Pointe Inverness Way PO Box 2357 Fort Wayne, IN 46801-2357	(888) 637-7661	(260) 203-3820	Gayle Newton gnewton@petroleumtraders.com
Buell Fuel LLC 2676 State Route 12B Deansboro, NY 13328	(315) 841-3000	(315) 841-3585	Garth Curtis garth@buellfuel.com

UNLEADED GASOLINE - REGULAR/ETHANOL (87 OCTANE)

(price per gallon)

Item	Mirabito	Petroleum Traders Corp.	Buell Fuel LLC
rack price per gallon 2/1/2019	1.5590	1.5590	1.5590
rust plus oil spill liability trust fund fees per gallon	0.0010	0.0029	0.0010
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon	0.0429	0.0799	0.0299
TOTAL	\$1.6029	1.6418	1.5899

Company	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Mirabito Energy Products The Metro Center 49 Court St. Binghamton NY 13902	607-352-2958	607-352-2822	Joe D'Esti joe.desti@mirabito.com
Petroleum Traders Corporation 7120 Pointe Inverness Way PO Box 2357 Fort Wayne, IN 46801-2357	(888) 637-7661	(260) 203-3820	Gayle Newton gnewton@petroleumtraders.com
Buell Fuel LLC 2676 State Route 12B Deansboro, NY 13328	(315) 841-3000	(315) 841-3585	Garth Curtis garth@buellfuel.com