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Cortland County Legislature
March 26, 2009
6:00 PM

Approved Minutes
Order of Business

Chairman Daniels opened the meeting, followed by the Pledge of Allegiance. The Clerk of the Legislature took roll call. All members were present, except Mr. Hartnett, who was excused.
Chairman Daniels called for approval of the minutes of the February 26 Regular Session.

Moved by Mr. Troy, seconded by Ms. Price. Mr. Williams noted one correction. The minutes were unanimously approved, pending a correction. 
Receive & File

Ms. Price made a motion to Receive and File a letter from Ms. Tytler to Town Supervisors; the 2009 Soil & Water Conservation District Plan of Action; and the 2008 Annual Report of the Cortland County Clerk. Seconded by Ms. Price. All members voting in favor. None opposed.

Old Business

Ms. Arnold made a motion that the Legislature request that the Ethics Committee determine the validity of the allegations that Chairman Daniels made in his memos in which he removed Carol Tytler, Chad Loomis and Tom Williams as Committee Chairs. Ms. Wilcox seconded the motion. The Clerk took a role call vote. (see attached) Ms. Arnold, Mr. Loomis, Mr. Ross, Ms. Tytler, Mr. Waldbauer, Ms. Wilcox, Mr. Willcox, and Mr. Williams voting in favor. The motion failed with 19,819 weighted votes. 
Mr. Waldbauer made a motion to have Mr. Schrader and department heads review the 2010 budget to suggest ways to cut up to 10 percent from spending. Mr. Willcox seconded the motion. All members voting in favor; none opposed. The motion passed. 
Ms. Wilcox asked the legislature Receive & File a letter from her to Chairman Daniels. The Clerk of the Legislature read the letter. Ms. Price made a motion to Receive & File. Seconded by Mr. Spaulding. All members voting in favor; none opposed. The motion passed.

New Business

Agenda Item No. 1 – Resolution Of The Cortland County Legislature Urging The New York State Senate And Assembly To Vote Against That Portion Of Bill S.60/A.160 That Seeks To Amend The Alcoholic Beverage Control Law
Mr. Williams made a motion to table Agenda Item No. 1. Seconded by Mr. Troy. All members voting in favor; none opposed. The motion was tabled. 

Agenda Item No. 2 – Appoint Member – Industrial Development Agency Board of Directors. 

On motion of Mr. Daniels. Seconded by Mr. Cornell. Ms. Tytler asked the Chairman to write a letter to Mr. Suits, thanking him for time served on the IDA Board. Mr. Tagliente asked to abstain from the vote, as he works for Mr. Suits. Ms. Price made a motion allowing Mr. Tagliente to abstain. Seconded by Mr. Cornell. All members voting in favor; none opposed. Mr. Daniels called the vote on Agenda Item No. 2. All members voting in favor; none opposed, with Mr. Tagliente abstained. The motion was approved, and Agenda Item No. 2 became: 
ON MOTION OF MR. DANIELS                                    
 RESOLUTION NO. 71-09

Appoint Member

Industrial Development Agency

Board of Directors
WHEREAS, pursuant to General Municipal Law 856, the Cortland County Legislature, on recommendation of the Chairman of the Cortland County Legislature, is required to appoint the members of the Industrial Development Agency Board of Directors, AND

WHEREAS, the resignation of Frank Suits Jr., was effective February 9, 2009, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT

RESOLVED, that Steve Compagni, 1657 Lighthouse Hill Road, 13077, be appointed to the Industrial Development Agency Board of Directors effective immediately until such time that the Cortland County Legislature make new appointments by Resolution at the end of the two years, AND BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, that the Clerk of the Legislature be and hereby is directed to send a certified copy of this resolution to the Secretary of State pursuant to Section 856.2 of General Municipal Law and an additional certified copy to the County Clerk.
Agenda Item No. 3 – Authorize Agreement – 6th Judicial Court District (Court Cleaning and Minor Repairs)
On motion of Mr. Tagliente. Seconded by Mr. Cornell. All members voting in favor; none opposed, and Agenda Item No. 3 became: 

ON MOTION OF MR. TAGLIENTE


RESOLUTION NO. 72-09
Authorize Agreement

6th Judicial Court District

(Court Cleaning and Minor Repairs)

Buildings & Grounds Department


WHEREAS, 1996 NYS Legislation, Senate Bill No. 4428-b, allowed for changes in Section 39-b of the Judiciary Law and amends Sections 54-j and 94920 of the State Finance Law, affecting the M&O procedures for the 6th Judicial Court District as it relates to Cortland County, AND,

WHEREAS, Cortland County has prepared a Budget for 2008-2009 as part of its responsibility for meeting the regulations for the above changes in the laws, AND,


WHEREAS, the NYS Unified Court System 6th Judicial District, has presented an agreement to the County for a period of April 1, 2008 through March 31, 2013 for Court Cleaning and Minor Repairs, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT,


RESOLVED, that upon review and approval by the County Attorney or his designee, the Chairman of the Cortland County Legislature is hereby authorized to execute an agreement with the NYS Unified Court System 6th Judicial District for Court Cleaning and Minor Repairs for the period April 1, 2008 through March 31, 2013.

Agenda Item No. 4 – Award Bids – Construction of DMV Facility
On motion of Mr. Tagliente; seconded by Mr. Cornell. Mr. Waldbauer asked for clarification on the resolution. Mr. Schrader explained the general construction contract includes the drive-through, and upgraded floor and ceiling tiles. The alternate for countertops was accepted, therefore it was omitted from the project. Ms. Wilcox noted that the cost of the project is over $2 million when including property acquisition and design of the building. Mr. Schrader agreed, saying about $510,000 has been spent to date. Mr. Loomis clarified that the plan includes space for the Board of Election’s Office. Mr. Troy noted that all money for the project is from “Tobacco Funds.” Mr. Williams pointed out that more than $1.25 million of Tobacco Funds has been spent so far, and nothing has been built yet. The Clerk took a roll-call vote. (see attached) Legislators Wilcox, Willcox and Williams voting against the resolution. The motion was approved with a weighted vote of 39,580, and Agenda Item No. 4 became:
ON MOTION OF MR. TAGLIENTE


RESOLUTION NO. 73-09
Award Bids

Construction of DMV Facility

WHEREAS, Resolution 182-08 engaged Barton and Loguidice and JCM Architectural Associates to Design and Prepare a Site Plan and Construction Drawings for a 7,500 Square Foot Building for the Department of Motor Vehicles on River Street, AND
WHEREAS, the Buildings & Grounds Committee of the Cortland County Legislature advertised, received and opened bids for the construction for the Department of Motor Vehicles on River Street, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that in accordance with the recommendations of the Buildings & Grounds Committee, the County accepts and awards the following bids for the Department of Motor Vehicles on River Street:
Contract No. 1 – General Construction



Diamond & Thiel Construction Company 
$1,310,000.00
Contract No. 2 – Mechanical Construction


Airside Technical Corporation


$   115,900.00

Contract No. 3 – Plumbing Construction


DWB Incorporated 



$     63,600.00

Contract No. 4 – Electrical Construction


Diekow Electric


 
$   136,000.00

AND BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, that the County Administrator shall have the authority to execute change orders, within appropriated amounts, necessary to complete the project, AND, BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, that the Chairman of the Legislature, upon review and approval by the County Attorney, is hereby authorized and directed to execute contracts with Diamond & Theil Construction Company, Airside Technical Corporation, DWB Incorporated and Diekow Electric, in the amount of $1,606,000, and said contracts will be paid from the proceeds of the Tobacco Securitization Bond.  

Agenda Item No. 5 – Authorize an Environmental Survey – South Main Street Property

On motion of Mr. Tagliente. Seconded by Mr. Troy. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 5 became:

ON MOTION OF MR. TAGLIENTE


RESOLUTION NO. 74-09
Authorize an Environmental Survey

South Main Street Property

WHEREAS, the Buildings & Grounds Committee and the County Administrator have identified the need for an environmental survey for property owned by the County or Cortland located on South Main Street, Cortland New York to determine the presence of environmentally sensitive building construction materials such as asbestos and lead, AND


WHEREAS, Barton & Loguidice, P.C., 290 Elwood Davis Road, Box 3107, Syracuse NY 13220 has submitted a proposal to provide Professional Environmental Services to the County of Cortland, in accordance with the rate schedule attached to the Engineering Agreement in an estimated amount of $12,000, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that the County Legislature hereby authorizes and directs that an environmental survey be conducted on the South Main Street Properties to determine the presence of environmentally sensitive building construction materials, AND, BE IT FURTHER 

RESOLVED, that the survey costs shall be paid for out of bond issued through Tobacco Securitization, AND BE IT FURTHER.


RESOLVED, that the County Administrator is authorized to execute an engagement letter with Barton & Loguidice, P.C. to conduct said survey under the terms and conditions of the term agreement between the County and Barton & Loguidice in an amount not to exceed $15,000.

Agenda Item No. 6 – Authorize Landfill Paving Project – Highway Department/Landfill
On motion of Mr. McKee. Sconded by Mr. Cornell. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 6 became: 

ON MOTION OF MR. MCKEE


              RESOLUTION NO. 75-09
Authorize Landfill Paving Project –

Highway Department/Landfill


WHEREAS, the Highway Superintendent has obtained approval from the NYSDEC to utilize a stockpile of bitumen contaminated soil from the 2002 Maintenance Facility Project as aggregate for a bituminous asphalt paving project at the Cortland County Landfill, AND

WHEREAS, the Highway Superintendent recommends that the production of the asphalt material for the said project should be produced under the Highway Department’s existing material bids, AND

WHEREAS, the Highway Superintendent recommends that the screening operations of the contaminated soil shall be performed by the Landfill General Contractor as a change order on existing contract, AND

WHEREAS, the Highway Superintendent recommends that the current landfill engineering firm shall conduct all necessary environmental monitoring and reporting as a change order on existing contract, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT

RESOLVED, that the Landfill Paving Project is hereby created as recommended by the Highway Superintendent, AND BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, that the Cortland County Treasurer be and is hereby authorized and directed to make payment from Account EL81605.54077.8165 Landfill Paving Project, which is a portion of the Materials and Supplies for the Construction of the Cortland County Landfill Phase II Liner Extension, AND BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, that the County Administrator is hereby authorized to execute any necessary change orders or other documents related to the advancement of the project not to exceed $200,000.00.

Agenda Item No. 7 – Authorize Amnesty Week – Highway Department/Landfill

On motion of Mr. McKee. Seconded by Mr. Ross. Ms. Tytler confirmed that there will also be a Household Hazardous Materials program later in the spring. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 7 became:
ON MOTION OF MR. MCKEE

                
RESOLUTION NO. 76-09
Authorize Amnesty Week

Highway Department/Landfill

WHEREAS, the Highway Committee of this Legislature has recommended at their March 10, 2009 meeting that the Municipalities of Cortland County be granted one week in the spring of 2009 to dispose of wastes other than garbage at no charge, AND

WHEREAS, the Highway Department is to be authorized to set the dates of such Amnesty week as May 11, 2009 to May 15, 2009, AND

WHEREAS, the Highway Department is to be authorized to establish the guidelines for such disposal, NOW THEREFORE, BE IT

RESOLVED, that Highway Department shall designate the week of May 11, 2009 to May 15, 2009 as the time period allotted for the Municipalities of Cortland County to dispose of their wastes at the Cortland County Landfill at no charge, AND BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, that the only vehicles exempt from the tipping fee payment during the aforementioned time period will be vehicles registered or their designated agents with a letter from the respective Chief Executive Officer, AND BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, that only metal objects (including white goods), tires, construction and demolition waste, and tree wastes will be accepted and shall be separated by category at the landfill site by the municipality making delivery, AND BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, that the Highway Department shall furnish the Legislature with an accounting of all wastes delivered to the landfill during Amnesty week.

Agenda Item No. 8 – Authorize Agreement – Cortland County and Suit-Kote Corporation/Fire & Emergency Management

On motion of Mr. Waldbauer. Seconded by Ms. Price. All members voting in favor; none opposed, and Agenda Item No. 8 became: 

ON MOTION OF MR. WALDBAUER


RESOLUTION NO. 77-09

Authorize Agreement

Cortland County and Suit-Kote Corporation

Fire & Emergency Management

WHEREAS, New York State mandated training for Firefighter I and Firefighter II certification is required as of April 1, 2004, AND

WHEREAS, the New York State Office of Fire Prevention and Control provides most of the training offered to Cortland County firefighters, AND 

WHEREAS, the New York State Office of Fire Prevention and Control has granted permission to the Cortland County firefighters to engineer a burn facility to deliver the training that the firefighters need to enter burning structures for rescue and fire extinguishments, AND

WHEREAS, the County of Cortland wishes to continue to use property owned and/or maintained by Suit-Kote, Inc., located at Homer Materials, Route 11, Health Camp Road, Homer, NY 13077, at no cost to the County to deliver the training that firefighters need to enter burning structures for rescue and fire extinguishments, NOW, THEREFORE BE IT

RESOLVED, that upon review and approval by the County Attorney or his designee, the Chairman of the County Legislature is authorized to enter into and Agreement with Suit-Kote, Inc. for a two year term commencing January 1, 2009 and expiring December 31, 2010.

Agenda Item No. 9 – Reappropriate Funds – Satellite UHF Site, Preble
On motion of Mr. Waldbauer. Seconded by Mr. Troy. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 9 became: 

ON MOTION OF MR. WALDBAUER


RESOLUTION NO. 78-09

Reappropriate Funds

Fire & Emergency Management

Satellite UHF Site, Preble


WHEREAS, Cortland County is in the process of improving the paging system for its emergency responders by upgrading the paging system from a low band system to an Ultra High Frequency (UHF) system, AND


WHEREAS, with the assistance and expertise of a consultant, it has been determined that several satellite sites will be needed around the county to enhance the communications capabilities of said UHF paging system, AND


WHEREAS, the Town of Preble has authorized an agreement with the County of Cortland to lease a ROHN 45, 100 foot, 3 guyed Tower satellite site located at 1968 Preble Road, Preble, NY 13141for a cost of $1.00, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT

RESOLVED, that the County Treasurer amend the 2009 budget as follows:

 

Expense


A34105 52015 3405

Preble UHF Site


$35,005.00

Appropriate Fund Balance


A0599



Preble UHF Site


$35,005.00

Agenda Item No. 10 – Authorize Agreement/Accept Funds – Health Department – EIP NYS Grant
On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Cornell. All members voting in favor; none opposed, and Agenda Item No. 10 became: 

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 79-09
Authorize Agreement/Accept Funds

Health Department/Children With Special Needs Program

(EIP NYS GRANT)


WHEREAS, continued funding from the NYS Department of Health is available in the amount of $34,396 for the Early Intervention Program (EIP), for the contract period October 1, 2008 through September 30, 2009, AND


WHEREAS, this amount has already been budgeted for the 2009 budget, in Expenditure Accounts A40595.51005-51010, $30,826 (Personnel), A40595.54000-54300.4052, $3,570 (Contractual) and Revenue Account A405944.44451, $34,396, AND

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT


RESOLVED, that the Chairman of the Legislature and the Public Health Director, or designees, upon review and approval by the County Attorney, are hereby authorized to  sign this agreement with the State of New York to accept these funds.

Agenda Item No. 11 – Authorize Agreement/Accept Funds – Health Department (NYS Grant)

On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Spaulding. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 11 became:
ON THE MOTION OF MS. PRICE


RESOLUTION NO. 80-09
Authorize Agreement/Accept Funds

Health Department/ Jacobus Center for Reproductive Health

(State Grant)


WHEREAS, the Bureau of Women’s Health of the New York State Health

Department has awarded the Jacobus Center for Reproductive Health $424,088 for 

their 2009 annual state grant, AND


WHEREAS, the Cortland County Health Dept. will be contracting with other agencies and individuals to help coordinate the efforts of this grant, AND


WHEREAS, $376,514 for fiscal year 01/01/2009 – 12/31/2009 funds are already 

reflected in the 2009 County Budget in  Expenditure Accounts A40355.51005-51040 $225,000 (Personal Services) A40355.58020-58065 $ 75,000 (Fringe) A40355.54000-54500 $ 76,514 (Contractual) and Revenue Account A403543.43435 $376,514, NOW THEREFORE BE IT,


RESOLVED, that the 2009 budget be amended as follows:


Increase:



Expenses:



A40355.52015


Technical Equipment


$  2,609



A40355.54001


Printing                       


$     260



A40355.54003


Office Furniture


$       70



A40355.54006


Medical Supplies


$35,892



A40355.54035


Training and Education

$     200



A40355.54060


Advertising



$  8,360



A40355.54075


Office Equipment


$     183


Increase:



Revenues:



A403543.43489

Family Planning State Aid

$47,574


RESOLVED, that the Chairman of the Legislature and Public Health Director or Designee, upon review and approval by the County Attorney, are hereby authorized to sign this agreement with NYS to accept these funds and with other agencies and individuals to help coordinate the efforts of this grant


Agenda Item No. 12 – Extend Bid/Authorize Agreement (Transportation of Children With Disabilities)
On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Spaulding. Ms. Tytler noted that Cortland County is doing a good job in that there are no children being transported out of County for this program, and commended the Health Department. Mr. Loomis asked about the projected cost to the county for the program. Ms. Feuerherm said about 34 children are participating, and 47 are budgeted for. Mr. Schrader said there is $400,000 budgeted. Ms. Wilcox asked if this was a mandated program. Mr. Schrader said that yes, it is. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 12 became:

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 81-09
Extend Bid/Authorize Agreement

Health Department/Children with Special Needs (Birth to 5)

(Transportation of Children with Disabilities)


WHEREAS, the County of Cortland is responsible for providing transportation for children with disabilities (ages birth through five years) for therapy and program participation, AND


WHEREAS, Birnie Bus Service, Inc. 248 Otis Street, Rome, NY 13441, was the lowest and only bidder for the period July 1, 2007 – June 30, 2009; AND


WHEREAS, the original bid of Birnie Bus Service, Inc. included an optional one-year extension to be adjusted by the Northeastern NY and NJ CPI; AND


WHEREAS, the Northeastern NY and NJ CPI for 2009 is 1.6%, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that the Birnie Bus Service, Inc. contract be extended for the one-year period July 1, 2009 – June 30, 2010, at the rates listed below:

Birnie Bus Service, Inc., 248 Otis Street, Rome NY 13441

All sites without bus monitor.

Site One – Franziska Racker Centers, 882 Route 13, Cortland, NY 13045

$21.59 per child per one way trip


$26.67 per child per one way trip with wheelchair accommodations

Site Two – Family Enrichment Network, 14 Clayton Avenue, Cortland NY 10345


$21.59 per child per one way trip


$26.67 per child per one way trip with wheelchair accommodations

Site Three – Children’s Unit for Treatment & Evaluation/Binghamton University, Binghamton


$254.00 Route Price (All inclusive, per day, single round trip)

Site Four – OCM BOCES, Children’s Village of Park Hill Elementary School, 303 Roby Avenue, Syracuse NY 13057


$264.16 Route Price (All inclusive, per day, single round trip)

Site Five – Franziska Racker Centers, 214 Elmira Road, Ithaca NY 14850


No bid per child per one way trip


$220.47 Route Price (All inclusive, per day, single round trip)

Site Six -Jowonio School, 3049 East Genesee Street, Syracuse NY


No bid per child per one way trip

$269.24 Route Price (All inclusive, per day, single round trip)

Site Seven – Other Cortland location (HeadStart, Daycare as needed)

$21.59 per child per one way trip


$26.67 per child per one way trip with wheelchair accommodations

Birnie Bus Service, Inc., 248 Otis Street, Rome NY 13441

All sites with bus monitor.

Site One – Franziska Racker Centers, 882 Route 13, Cortland, NY 13045

$28.13 per child per one way trip


$33.21 per child per one way trip with wheelchair accommodations

Site Two – Family Enrichment Network, 14 Clayton Avenue, Cortland NY 10345


$28.13 per child per one way trip


$33.21 per child per one way trip with wheelchair accommodations

Site Three – Children’s Unit for Treatment & Evaluation/Binghamton University, Binghamton


$322.07 Route Price (All inclusive, per day, single round trip)

Site Four – OCM BOCES, Children’s Village of Park Hill Elementary School, 303 Roby Avenue, Syracuse NY 13057


$333.25 Route Price (All inclusive, per day, single round trip)

Site Five – Franziska Racker Centers, 214 Elmira Road, Ithaca NY 14850


No bid per child per one way trip


$280.42 Route Price (All inclusive, per day, single round trip)

Site Six -Jowonio School, 3049 East Genesee Street, Syracuse NY


No bid per child per one way trip

$337.31 Route Price (All inclusive, per day, single round trip)

Site Seven – Other Cortland location (HeadStart, Daycare as needed)

$28.13 per child per one way trip


$33.21 per child per one way trip with wheelchair accommodations, AND BE IT FURTHER


RESOLVED, that the Chairman of the Legislature and the Public Health Director, or designee, upon review and approval by the County Attorney are hereby authorized to enter into an agreement extension with Birnie Bus Service, Inc. for the one-year period July 1, 2009, through June 30, 2010.

Agenda Item No. 13 – Abolish/Create Part-time Deputy Public Health Director/Full-time Deputy Health Director

On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Spaulding. Ms. Feuerherm said that there is a need for a full-time deputy, and this resolution, in conjunction with the next two, will save the county about $50,000 per year, not including fringe benefits. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 13 became:

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 82-09
Abolish/Create

Part-time Deputy Public Health Director/Full-time Deputy Public Health Director

Cortland County Health Department 



WHEREAS, the needs of the agency will be better served by abolishing one part-time position of Deputy Public Health Director and creating one full-time position of Deputy Public Health Director, AND



WHEREAS, the Budget & Finance/Health Committees recommend the abolition and creation of these positions, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that one part-time position of Deputy Public Health Director (Management grade 4, $57,599-70,078/yr, competitive class) be and hereby is abolished effective March 26, 2009, AND BE IT FURTHER


RESOLVED, that one position of full-time Deputy Public Health Director (Management grade 4, $57,599-70,078/yr, competitive class) be created effective March 26, 2009, AND BE IT FURTHER


RESOLVED, that the 2009 Cortland County budget be amended as follows:


     Increase: 


            Expenses:  A40105.51005  Health Administration Full Time Personnel  $51,055


     Decrease:


            Expenses: A40105.51010 Health Administration Part Time Personnel    $51,055

Agenda Item No. 14 – Abolish/Create Supervising Public Health Nurse and Early Intervention Service Coordinator/Supervising Early Intervention Service Coordinator
On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Cornell. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 14 became: 

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 83-09
Abolish/Create

 Supervising Public Health Nurse and Early Intervention Service Coordinator/Supervising Early Intervention Service Coordinator

Cortland County Health Department



WHEREAS, the needs of the agency will be better served by abolishing one full-time position of Supervising Public Health Nurse and one full-time position of Early Intervention Service Coordinator and creating one full-time position of Supervising Early Intervention Service Coordinator, AND



WHEREAS, the Budget & Finance/Health Committees recommend the abolition and creation of these positions, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that one full-time position of Supervising Public Health Nurse (NYSNA grade 4, $26.2212-30.4132/hr, competitive class) and one full-time position of Early Intervention Service Coordinator (CSEA grade 23, $22.7104-27.6307/hr.) be and hereby are abolished effective May 15, 2009, AND BE IT FURTHER


RESOLVED, that one position of full-time Supervising Early Intervention Service Coordinator (CSEA grade 25, $24.5108-29.8211/hr, competitive class) be created effective May 15, 2009.

Agenda Item No. 15 – Create Part-time Public Health Sanitarian (Health Department)
On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Troy. All members in favor; none opposed, and Agenda Item No. 15 became: 

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 84-09
Health Department

Create Part-time Public Health Sanitarian



WHEREAS, the needs of the agency will be better served by creating one part-time position of Public Health Sanitarian, AND



WHEREAS, the Health Committee recommends the creation of this position, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that one part-time position of Public Health Sanitarian (CSEA grade 19, $19.5985-23.8446/hr., competitive class) be and hereby is created effective May 1, 2009, AND BE IT FURTHER


RESOLVED, that the 2009 Cortland County budget be amended as follows:


             Increase:


                          Expenses:  


                                      A40125.51010  Part time Personnel
$2,000



Decrease:  




Expenses:

                                                  A40125.54055.4025  MSVC Professional Svces    $2,000      

Agenda Item No. 16 – Appoint Part-time Staff Psychiatrist – Mental Health Department

On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Spaulding. Ms. Wilcox said that she would rather hire a child psychiatrist, than a part-time psychiatrist. Mr. Kilmer said the Mental Health Department would also prefer a child-psychiatrist, but despite many efforts the position has not been able to be filled, and he does not think it is feasible to fill it at this point. He said that hiring a part-time psychiatrist will assist the Mental Health department and provide better service to Cortland County residents. Chairman Daniels called for a vote. Legislators Piombo, Loomis, Willcox, Wilcox, Williams and Ross voting against the motion. The motion was approved, and Agenda Item No. 16 became: 
ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 85-09

Appoint Part Time Staff Psychiatrist
Mental Health Department

             WHEREAS, the Cortland County Legislator has authorized a part time staff psychiatrist position in the Mental Health Department to address the psychiatric need of the County, AND


  WHEREAS, the County has received an application for the position and wishes to enter into an employment agreement with the individual, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


  RESOLVED, that the County Legislature does hereby appoint Evan DeLucia-Deranja, MD, pursuant to the terms and conditions of the employment agreement attached hereto, to commence July 1, 2009, AND BE IT FURTHER,


RESOLVED, that Evan DeLucia-Deranja, MD, shall receive an annual salary of ninety nine thousand and eight dollars ($99,008) as set forth in the attached employment agreement, AND BE IT FURTHER,


RESOLVED, that the Chairman of the Cortland County Legislature, upon review and approval to form by the County Attorney, be and hereby is authorized and directed to execute the employment agreement with Evan DeLucia-Deranja, MD, (to be paid from account No. A43105 51010 4200).

ATTACHMENT

EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT

STAFF PSYCHIATRIST

COUNTY OF CORTLAND

THIS AGREEMENT, made and entered into this day of July 1, 2009 by and between the County of Cortland, State of New York, a municipal corporation, with a principal address of 60 Central Avenue, Cortland, New York, hereinafter called "Employer", as party of the first part, and, Doctor Evan DeLucia-Deranja whose address is 142 Sunridge Ave Camillus, NY 13031, hereinafter called "Employee", as party of the second part, both of whom understand as follows:

WITNESSETH:

WHEREAS, Employer desires to employ the services of said Doctor Evan DeLucia-Deranja as the Staff Psychiatrist for the Department of Mental Health of the County of Cortland; and

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the Cortland County Legislature, hereinafter called the "Legislature" to provide certain benefits, establish certain conditions of employment and to set working conditions of said Employee; and

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the Legislature to (1) secure and retain the services of Employee and to provide inducement for him to remain in such employment, (2) to make possible full work productivity by assuring Employee's morale and peace of mind with respect to future security, (3) to act as a deterrent against malfeasance or dishonesty for personal gain on the part of Employee, and (4) to provide a just means for terminating Employee's services at such time as he may be unable to discharge his duties due to age or disability or when Employer may otherwise desire to terminate his employ; and

WHEREAS, Employee desires employment as the Staff Psychiatrist for the Mental Health Department of the County of Cortland;

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual covenants herein contained, the parties agree as follows:

Section 1. Duties

Employer hereby agrees to employ said Doctor Evan DeLucia-Deranja as Staff Psychiatrist for the Mental Health Department of the County of Cortland. Employee shall perform the functions and duties of the position as specified in the job description for the position, as well as the laws of the State of New York, the applicable local laws and resolutions of the County of Cortland Legislature and other legally permissible and proper duties and functions as the County Administrator and/or Legislature shall from time to time assign.

Section 2. Term

A. Nothing in this agreement shall prevent, limit or otherwise interfere with the right of the Legislature to terminate the services of Employee at any time, subject only to the provisions set forth in Section 3, paragraphs A, of this agreement.

B. Nothing in this agreement shall prevent, limit or otherwise interfere with the right of the Employee to resign at any time from his position with Employer.

C. Employee agrees to remain in the primary employ of Employer for one year from the execution date of this agreement.

D. In the event written notice is not given by either party to this agreement to the other 180 days prior to the termination date as hereinabove provided, this agreement shall be extended on the same terms and conditions as herein provided, all for an additional period of one year. Said agreement shall continue thereafter for one year periods unless either party hereto gives 180 days written notice to the other party that the party does not wish to extend this agreement for an additional one year term. 

Section 3. Termination and Severance 

A. In the event Employer at any time during the term of this agreement reduces the salary or other financial benefits of Employee in a greater percentage than an applicable across-the-board reduction for all employees of Employer; or in the event Employer refuses, following written notice, to comply with any other provision benefiting Employee herein, in that event, Employee, may, at his option, be deemed to be "terminated" at the date of such reduction or such refusal to comply within the meaning and context of the herein agreement.  

Section 4. Disability

If Employee is permanently disabled or is otherwise unable to perform his duties because of sickness, accident, injury, mental incapacity or health, as determined by a qualified health care professional, except an accident or injury under Workers’ Compensation, for a period of four successive weeks, or for twenty working days over a thirty working day period, Employer shall have the option to terminate this agreement.  However, Employee shall be compensated for any accrued benefits.

Section 5. Salary

Employer agrees to pay Employee for his services rendered pursuant hereto an annual base salary of $99,008, payable in installments at the same time as other employees of the Employer are paid. 

Section 6. Performance Evaluation

A. The Clinical Director of the Cortland County Mental Health Department shall review and evaluate the performance of the Employee at least once annually during Employee's anniversary month and six (6) months prior to the termination of this agreement and consideration of reappointment.  The Clinical Director of the Cortland County Mental Health Department, or his/her designee, shall provide the Employee with a summary written statement of the findings contained within the performance evaluation and provide an adequate opportunity for the Employee to discuss his evaluation with the Administrator in closed session, as per the laws of the State of New York.

B. In effecting the provisions of this Section, the County and Employee mutually agree to abide by the provisions of applicable law.

Section 7. Hours of Work

It is recognized that Employee must devote a great deal of time outside of the normal office hours to business of the Employer, and to that end Employee will be allowed to take discretionary time off as he shall deem appropriate during said normal office hours. Employee is subject to a normal Seventeen (17) hour week requirement. Discretionary time shall accrue upon completion of the required 17 hours in a given week and is subject to the limitations as apply to other salaried employees of Employer. 

Section 8. Disability, Health and Life Insurance

A. Employer agrees to put into force and to make required premium payments for Employee for insurance policies for medical and dental group coverage for Employee and Employee's dependents as per coverage provided employees in the Management Compensation Policy.

Section 9.   Fringe Benefits

Employee shall receive fringe benefits equal to and commensurate with Management Compensation Policy. 

Section 10 Retirement

Employer agrees to participate in the New York Retirement System and to pay into the system, on Employee's behalf, the percentage equal to that which is provided all general employees of the County.

Section 11. Indemnification

Employer shall defend, save harmless and indemnify Employee against any tort, professional liability claim or demand or other legal action, arising out of an alleged act or omission occurring within the scope of Employee's duties as Staff Psychiatrist for the Mental Health Department of the County of Cortland as provided by the laws of the State of New York. Employer, or its insurance carrier, may, without personal cost to Employee, compromise and settle any such claim or suit and pay the amount of any settlement or judgment rendered thereon.

Section 12. Notices
Notices pursuant to this agreement shall be given by deposit in the custody of the United States Postal Service, postage prepaid, addressed as follows:

(1) EMPLOYER:


Cortland County Administrator 

Cortland County

60 Central Avenue

Cortland, New York 13045

(2) EMPLOYEE:       


Doctor Evan DeLucia-Deranja 

142 Sunridge Ave 

Camillus, NY 13031

Alternatively, notices required pursuant to this agreement may be personally served in the same manner as is applicable to civil judicial practice. Notice shall be deemed given as of the date of personal service or as of the date of deposit of such written notice in the course of transmission in the United States Postal Service.

Section 13. General Provisions

A.  The text herein shall constitute the entire agreement between the parties.

B. This agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the benefit of the heirs at law and executors of Employee.

C. This agreement shall become effective commencing July 1, 2009.

D.  
If any provision, or any portion thereof, contained in this agreement is held       unconstitutional, invalid or unenforceable, the remainder of this agreement, or portion thereof, shall be deemed severable, shall not be affected and shall remain in full force and effect.

________________________
ATTEST:






John Daniels, Chairman

Clerk of the Legislature




County of Cortland

Cortland County, New York




Cortland County, New York











APPROVED AS TO FORM








County Attorney




























___________________________


Employee      

Agenda Item No. 17 – Accept Bids/Authorize Purchase – Area Agency on Aging/Nutrition – Miscellaneous Groceries and Frozen Foods

On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Troy. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 17 became: 

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 86-09
Accept Bids/Authorize Purchase

Area Agency on Aging/Nutrition

Miscellaneous Groceries and Frozen Foods


WHEREAS, bids were received on March 5, 2009 for the period April 1, 2009 through June 30, 2009 for the purchase of miscellaneous groceries and frozen foods in accordance with specifications on file in the Office of the Clerk of the Cortland County Legislature, for use by the Area Agency on Aging, the Sheriff’s Department and Horizon House, AND


WHEREAS, your Human Services Committee recommends that bids be awarded to the lowest bidder, AND


WHEREAS, the following bids were received:


Ginsberg’s, Route 66, Hudson, NY 12534


Maines Paper & Food Serv, Inc, 101 Broome Corp Pkwy, PO Box 450, Conklin, NY 13748


Quandt’s, PO Box 700, Amsterdam, NY 12010


Reinhart Food Service, 11 Dennis St., Kirkwood, NY 13795


NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that bids of the said vendors, in accordance with the specifications, be and hereby are accepted at the bid prices on a per item basis, AND BE IT FURTHER


RESOLVED, that the above departments are authorized and directed to purchase said items from the low bidders for the period April 1, 2009 through June 30, 2009.

Agenda Item No. 18 – Accept Grant/Amend Budget – Statewide Activities Gas Card Initiative

On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Cornell. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 18 became: 

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 87-09
Accept Grant/Amend Budget

Department of E&T Grant Administration

Statewide Activities Gas Card Initiative


WHEREAS, the New York State Department of Labor has awarded the Cayuga-Cortland Workforce Investment Area in the amount of $12,500.00 ($6,250.00 per county) for the Statewide Activities Gas Card Initiative, AND


WHEREAS, the Cayuga-Cortland LWIA shall make the funds available to eligible WIA Title I unemployed participants to purchase gas cards and/or help defray the costs of driving to or from: the One Stop Career Center to receive services, attend workshops or training; job fairs; and area employers to conduct a bonafide job search, NOW, THEREFORE BE IT


RESOLVED, the Chairman of Legislature and Cortland County E&T Grant Administrator, upon review and approval by the County Attorney, be and hereby are authorized to accept the WIA Statewide Activities Gas Card Initiative.  Receipt of funds is contingent upon establishing local polices, procedures, and controls for the administration of these funds and this assistance is only available in so far as there is funding available to provide such services, AND, BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, the Program Year 2008 (July 1, 2008-June 30, 2009) E&T Grant Administration agency budget be and hereby is amended as follows:

Increase:



C-1200
Cash





$12,500.00

Increase:


C-2631
Due to Cayuga County


  $6,250.00 


C-2633
Due to Cortland County


  $6,250.00

Agenda Item No. 19 – Accept Grant/Amend Budget – Department of E&T Grant Administration – Economic Stimulus Funds

On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Spaulding. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 19 became: 

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 88-09

Accept Grant/Amend Budget

Department of E&T Grant Administration

Economic Stimulus Funds


WHEREAS, the American Recovery and Reinvestment Act has been officially enacted, On February 17, 2009, AND


WHEREAS, funds can be expended immediately upon enactment, AND

WHEREAS, the Cayuga-Cortland LWIA is projected to receive $1,003,087.00 in  Economic Stimulus Funds of which 1.5% or $15,047.00 will be due to the Department of E&T Grant Administration and $988,040.00 will be due to the Cayuga and Cortland Departments of Employment and Training, NOW, THEREFORE BE IT


RESOLVED, the Chairman of Legislature and Cortland County E&T Grant Administrator, upon review and approval by the County Attorney, be and hereby are authorized to accept these funds, AND, BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, The Department of Employment & Training and the Department of Employment & Training Grant Administration will modify their approved 2009 budgets to receive and expend these funds.

Increase:



C28943746   Economic Stimulus Funds 




         Grant Administration for Adult


  $2,648.00



C28943747   Economic Stimulus Funds 




         Grant Administration for Youth


  $7,058.00                 



C28943748   Economic Stimulus Funds 



         Grant Administration for Dislocated Worker      $5,341.00

Increase:


C-2631
Due to Cayuga County

           $530,439.00 


C-2633
Due to Cortland County

           $457,601.00

Agenda Item No. 20 – Authorize Agreement/Amend Budget – CNY Works, Inc., and Department of E&T Grant Administration

On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Troy. Ms. Price made a motion for a friendly amendment to the resolution. Seconded by Mr. Cornell. All members in favor of the amendment, none opposed. Chairman Daniels called for a  vote. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 20 became: 
ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE  



AGENDA ITEM NO. 89-09

Authorize Agreement/ Amend Budget 

between CNY Works, Inc. 

and 

Department of E&T Grant Administration

(On behalf of Cayuga-Cortland Workforce Investment Board)


WHEREAS, the New York State Department of Labor has awarded CNY Works, Inc. of Syracuse a tier two application for $500,000.00 for Regional Economic Transformation Strategies Through a Sector or Cluster Based Approach, NYSDOL Grant #13-N, for a five county region that includes the Cayuga-Cortland Local Workforce Investment Area, AND


WHEREAS, $54,000.00 of these funds are to be used to identify businesses in Cayuga and Cortland Counties working in the Energy & Environmental Systems Cluster, solicit their participation and partner with them for an internship program.  Funds will be used to create fourteen internships, seven each in Cayuga and Cortland Counties, monitor program progress, and fulfill program reporting and evaluation requirements, AND

WHEREAS, CNY Works desires to obtain services from the Cayuga-Cortland Workforce Investment Board under the Grant Award Agreement, and the Cayuga-Cortland Workforce Investment Board is willing to provide service to CNY Works, NOW, THEREFORE BE IT


RESOLVED, the Chairman of Legislature and Cortland County E&T Grant Administrator, upon review and approval by the County Attorney, be and hereby are authorized to enter into a Agreement with CNY Works, Inc., AND, BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, The agency budget be and hereby is amended by establishing the following accounts:

Increase:



C 1200
    Cash



           $54,000.00

Increase:



C 299 43745 Grant Administration 13-N




          Grant Revenue



$   3,457.00

C 2631          Due to Cayuga County


$ 25,234.00



C 2633          Due to Cortland County
    
$ 25,309.00

Agenda Item No. 21 – Employment & Training Department – Create Two Temporary E&T Special Program Counselors

On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Spaulding. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 21 became: 

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE



RESOLUTION NO. 90-09
Employment and Training Department

Create 2 Temporary E&T Special Programs Counselors



WHEREAS, the needs of the agency will be better served by creating two temporary, full-time positions of E&T Special Programs Counselor, AND



WHEREAS, the Budget & Finance Committee recommends the creation of these positions, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that one temporary, full-time position of E&T Special Programs Counselor (CSEA grade 9, $14.0206-17.0582/hr., competitive class) be and hereby is created effective April 1, 2009 for a period of up to six months, AND BE IT FURTHER


RESOLVED, that one temporary, full-time position of E&T Special Programs Counselor (CSEA grade 9, $14.0206-17.0582/hr, competitive class) be and hereby is created effective June 1, 2009 until August 31, 2009.
Agenda Item No. 22 – Accept Donation/Amend Budget – Youth Bureau (Cortland Community Foundation)

On motion of Ms. Price. Seconded by Mr. Troy. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 22  became: 

ON MOTION OF MS. PRICE                                                 RESOLUTION NO. 91-09
Accept Donation/Amend Budget

Youth Bureau

(Cortland Community Foundation)

WHEREAS, a “pass-through Donation” from Cortland Community Foundation, in the amount of $3,000.00 was awarded to the Youth Bureau to be used for the Cortland County Youth Leadership Program, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT

RESOLVED, that the County Budget be and hereby is amended as follows:

Increase:

Expense:


A73125.54083        Supporting Services                                   $3,000.00

Revenue:


A731242.42705      Gifts & Donations                                      $3,000.00

Agenda Item No 23 – Amend 2009 Budget/Planning Department – 5311 STOA Program
On motion of Mr. Ross. Seconded by Ms. Price. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 23 became: 

ON MOTION OF MR. ROSS



RESOLUTION NO. 92-09
Amend 2009 Budget

Planning Department

(5311 STOA Program)


WHEREAS, The County of Cortland has received a “clean up” SFY 2008-2009 Statewide Mass Transportation Operating Assistance (STOA) payment from the New York State Department of Transportation under Federal Section 5311 for transit operating assistance, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that to continue this program for the period of January 1, 2009 to December 31, 2009 the 2009 County Budget is hereby amended as follows: 

Increase:

Expense:

A80225.54081   5311 STOA   

$154,954.03


Increase:



Revenue:




A802243.43594   5311 STOA

$154,954.03

Agenda Item No. 24 – Authorize Agreement/Medco – Prescription Drug Program Administration

On motion of Mr. Cornell. Seconded by Mr. Spaulding. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 24 became:

ON MOTION OF MR. CORNELL                                      RESOLUTION NO. 93-09
Authorize Agreement/ Medco

Prescription Drug Program Administration


WHEREAS, requests for proposals were requested by Benefit Consulting Group for the Administration of the Prescription Drug Program for Cortland County, AND


WHEREAS, it is the recommendation of Benefit Consulting Group, the County Administrator and Personnel Officer, that the County of Cortland Contract with Medco for Administration of the Prescription Drug Program for Cortland County, NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT


RESOLVED, that the Chairman of the Legislature, upon review and approval by the County Attorney, is hereby authorized to execute an agreement with Medco for a period of 43 months beginning June 1, 2009 and ending Dec. 31, 2012 in accordance with the proposal dated Feb. 9, 2009.

Agenda Item No. 25 – Authorize Engagement of Hancock & Estabrook/Legal Services – Wind Project

On motion of Mr. Troy. Seconded by Mr. Ross. Ms. Willcox asked if there is a cost associated with the services. Mr. Schrader explained that an escrow account will be set up to allow for the windmill company, TCI Renewables, to pay for this and other related services. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 25 became:
ON MOTION OF MR. TROY



RESOLUTION NO. 94-09
Authorize Engagement of Hancock & Estabrook

Legal Services – Wind Project

WHEREAS, the Cortland County Agriculture & Planning Committee has recommended obtaining legal services in the State Environmental Quality Review process for an alternative energy (wind) project proposed by TCI Renewables in the towns of Cortlandville, Homer, Solon and Truxton, AND


WHEREAS, Hancock & Estabrook, 100 Madison Street, Syracuse, NY  13202, has submitted a proposal for legal representation, the cost of which will be reimbursed to the county by TCI Renewables, NOW, THEREFORE BE IT


RESOLVED, that the Chairman of the Legislature, upon review and approval of the County Attorney, be and hereby is authorized and directed to engage Hancock & Estabrook to represent and counsel  the County and the Towns relating to the proposed project. 
Agenda Item No. 26 – Authorize Development/Information Technology – Centralized Property Tax Collection Data Program

On motion of Mr. Troy. Seconded by Mr. Spaulding. All members voting in favor; none opposed and Agenda Item No. 26 became: 

ON MOTION OF MR. TROY                                      
RESOLUTION NO. 95-09

Authorize Development

Information Technology

Centralized Property Tax Collection Data Program
     WHEREAS, the Cortland County Legislature, by Resolution No. 281-08, authorized a study on the procedures and potential benefits of moving towards a centralized tax collection database in Cortland County, AND

     WHEREAS, the purpose of the study was to satisfy the requirements of a $50,000 Centralized Property Tax Collection Data Program Grant, $25,000 of which has already been received, AND

     WHEREAS, an additional $25,000 is available to the county upon the completion of the study and upon implementation of a centralized program, AND

     WHEREAS, the study was completed by Empire Software Solutions and presented to the Budget and Finance Committee in December 2008, AND 

     WHEREAS, one of the recommendations in the study was to expand the tax collection program already developed by our Information Technology Department, NOW THEREFORE BE IT 

     RESOLVED, that the Legislature authorizes the Information Technology Department to expand and develop their current tax collection program to incorporate the elements required in the Grant.

Executive Session

Mr. Troy made a motion to go into executive session to discuss pending litigation. Seconded by Mr. Cornell. All members voting in favor; none opposed. The Legislature held an executive session
Adjourn

Following the executive session, Mr. Williams made a motion to adjourn. Seconded by Mr. Piombo. The meeting was adjourned. 
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