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Company Bid

Plant Location(s) Phone Fax Contact Person

Suit-Kote Corp. McGraw 753-1100 758-0760 Don McEvoy
1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. 745-2040 315-238-7110 dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
Cortland, NY 13045

F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. Whitney Point 607-687-1114 607-687-1856 Peter E. Fiorini, Jr.
3430 State Rte. 434 Owego pefiorini@fslopke.com
Apalachin, NY  13732 Lounsberry

Hanson Aggregates NY LLC South Onondaga 315-469-3217 315-469-3940 Roger Hutchinson
P.O. Box A Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com
Nedrow, NY 13120

Cranesville Aggregate Co. Rte 11A 315-408-4449 315-773-4512 Robert VanCoughnett
1250 Riverfront Center Tully rvancoughnett@cranesville.com
Amsterdam, NY 12010

T. H. Kinsella, Inc. Delphi Falls or 315-637-3390 315-637-1808 Allan Curtis
P.O. Box 7 Homer allanecurtis@yahoo.com
Fayetteville, NY 13066

RMS Gravel Inc. Dryden 607-844-8196 607-844-3752 Valerie Darling
290 Mott Road rmsgravel@yahoo.com
PO Box 455
Dryden. NY 13053

Fuller's Excavation, LLC Cincinnatus, NY 607-745-6665 n/a Dana Fuller
PO Box 182 fullersllc@aol.com
Cincinnatus, NY 13040

ABRASIVES FOR SNOW & ICE CONTROL 

Company

(price per ton)

RMS $6.75 

Fuller's $8.00 

F.S. Lopke $9.50 

Cranesville $9.50 

Suit-Kote $9.70 

T. H. Kinsella $9.95 

Hanson Aggregates $9.50 

mailto:dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
mailto:pefiorini@stny.rr.com
mailto:Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com
mailto:rvancoughnett@cranesville.com
mailto:allanecurtis@yahoo.com
mailto:rmsgravel@yahoo.com
mailto:fullersllc@aol.com
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 HFRS-2 $1.627 No Bid
TACK COAT $6.000 No Bid

HFMS-2 $2.022 No Bid
AEP-M $1.490 No Bid
AEDC $1.450 No Bid
AEFC $1.400 No Bid

HFMS-2ST $1.940 No Bid
HFMS-2C $2.248 No Bid

HFMS-2GH $2.283 No Bid
HFMS-1 $2.052 No Bid
HFRS-2P $1.950 No Bid
HFMS-1P $2.192 No Bid
HFMS-2P $2.257 No Bid

Distributer No Charge No Bid
Roller (per day) $1,450.00 No Bid

Spreader (per day) $1,525.00 No Bid
Flow Boy (per hour) $130.00 No Bid

Ten Wheel Dump Truck (per hour) $110.00 No Bid

Company Phone Fax Contact Person

Suit-Kote Corp. 753-1100 758-0760 Lorraine Titus
1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. 745-2040 315-238-7110 ltitus@suit-kote.com
Cortland, NY 13045 Don McEvoy

dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

Vestal Asphalt, Inc. 607-343-7210 607-785-3396 Garrett Gulies
201 Stage Road gguiles@vestalashalt.com
Vestal, NY 13850

BITUMINOUS MATERIALS - LIQUID
(price per gal unless noted)

Bid prices listed are extended prices from 2016

Equipment (with Operator) Suit-Kote Vestal Asphalt

Bituminous Material Suit-Kote Vestal Asphalt

mailto:ltitus@suit-kote.com
mailto:dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
mailto:gguiles@vestalashalt.com
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403.11 Type 1 Base $54.35 $55.20 $50.50
403.12 Type 2 Base $49.05 $54.00 $50.50
403.13 Type 3 Binder $56.65 $57.00 $54.00
4013.17 Type 6F (1AF Top) $63.30 $67.60 $59.00
403.19 Type 7F (1ACF Top) $65.10 $71.00 $62.50
403.15 Type 5 Shim $73.65 $70.25 $80.00
Multi-Grade Modified Asphalt for use in place of 
Standard Asphalt in above conventional HMA 
items

$14.00 N/A No Bid

NYSDOT Item 15403.2010 Plant Mixed $78.95 No Bid No Bid
NYSDOT Item 15403.2020 Cold Mix $75.20 $85.00 No Bid
NYSDOT Item 15403.2030 Modified $93.40 No Bid No Bid
NYSDOT 405.0101 Type 1 Cold $51.35 No Bid $125.00
NYSDOT Item 405.0102 Type 2 Cold $51.10 No Bid $125.00
406.13 Dense Grade Cold-3C Binder $49.75 No Bid $125.00
406.13 Dense Cold 3C Binder (Recycled) $53.75 No Bid No Bid
406.19 7CF Top (High Friction) $58.93 No Bid No Bid
18403.376 $54.20 $52.50 $49.00
18403.256 $55.50 $56.00 $50.75
18403.126 $62.85 $63.00 $60.00
18403.956 $67.10 $67.25 $63.50
Modified Asphalt Hot Sand $82.25 N/A No Bid
Pretreated Sand $40.15 No Bid No Bid

Rental - Barber Green or equal with 2 Operators 
(per day) $2,850.00 No Bid $4,000.00

Rental - Ingersol-Rand DD-110 Roller with 1 
Operator (per day) $1,600.00 No Bid $2,000.00

Ten Wheel Dump Truck (per hour) $95.00 No Bid $90.00
Flow Boy (per hour) $120.00 No Bid $125.00
Trucking of Materials (per ton/mile) $0.41 $0.40 $0.25

Company Plant Location(s) Phone Fax Contact Person

Suit-Kote Corp. Cortlandville 753-1100 758-0760 Lorraine Titus
1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. 745-2040 315-238-7110 ltitus@suit-kote.com
Cortland, NY 13045 Don McEvoy

dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

Hanson Aggregates NY LLC Skaneateles 315-469-5501 315-469-3133 Roger Hutchinson
PO Box 513 315-685-3321 Roger.Hutchinson@Hanson.com
Jamesville, NY 13078

Northern Asphalt, LLC Syracuse 315-433-5115 315-458-9684 Richard Riccelli
6131 East Taft Road richr@riccellienterprises.com
North Syracuse, NY 13212

Equipment / Service Suit-Kote Hanson Northern Asphalt

BITUMINOUS CONCRETE
(price per ton unless noted)

Bid prices listed are extended prices from 2016

Bituminous Material Suit-Kote Hanson Northern Asphalt

mailto:ltitus@suit-kote.com
mailto:dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
mailto:Roger.Hutchinson@Hanson.com
mailto:richr@riccellienterprises.com
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0 - 300 gal $16.25 $16.54
301 - 600 gal $11.84 $12.64
601 - 1000 gal $10.89 $10.56

1001 gal + $9.39 $9.71

Company Plant Location(s) Phone Fax Contact Person

Suit-Kote Corp. Cortlandville 753-1100 758-0760 Lorraine Titus
1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. 745-2040 315-238-7110 ltitus@suit-kote.com
Cortland, NY 13045 Don McEvoy

dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

Vestal Asphalt, Inc. 607-343-7210 607-785-3396 Garrett Gulies
201 Stage Road gguiles@vestalashalt.com
Vestal, NY 13850

CRACK FILLING
(price gal/day)

Bid prices listed are extended prices from 2016

Crack Fill Suit-Kote Vestal

mailto:ltitus@suit-kote.com
mailto:dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
mailto:gguiles@vestalashalt.com
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Supplier #1ST #1A #1 #2 #3 #1 & #1A Mix #1 & #2 Mix
RMS N/B $13.25 $13.00 $12.25 N/B $13.00 $13.00

Suit-Kote $10.50 $14.50 $13.00 $13.00 N/B $14.25 $13.50
F.S. Lopke $15.00 $15.00 $12.50 $12.50 $13.50 $14.00 $13.00

Hanson $15.00 $16.00 $14.00 $14.00 $14.00 $16.00 $14.00
Cranesville N/B $14.00 $12.75 $12.50 N/B $14.25 $13.00

T.H. Kinsella N/B $14.50 $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $14.50 $13.50
Fuller's N/B N/B N/B $10.00 $10.00 N/B $13.00

Cortlandville N/B N/B $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 N/B $12.00

Plant Location(s) Phone Fax

RMS Gravel Inc. Dryden 607-844-8196 607-844-3752
PO Box 455
Dryden. NY 13053

Suit-Kote Corp. Polkville 753-1100 758-0760
1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. 745-2040 315-238-7110
Cortland, NY 13045

F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. Whitney Point 607-687-1114 607-687-1856
3430 State Rte. 434 Oxford
Apalachin, NY  13732 1A's 1ST's Owego

only

Hanson Aggregates NY LLC Jamesville 315-469-3217 315-469-3940
PO Box A Skaneateles Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com
Nedrow, NY 13120

Cranesville Aggregate Co. RTE 11A 315-408-4449 315-773-4512
1250 Riverfront Center Tully, NY
Amsterdam, NY 12010

T. H. Kinsella Fayetteville 315-637-3390 315-637-1808
PO Box 7 Jamesville
Fayetteville, NY 13066 Delphi Falls

Fuller's Excavation, LLC Cincinnatus 607-745-6665 n/a
PO Box 182
Cincinnatus, NY 13040

Cortlandville Sand & Gravel South Cortland 607-756-2115 607-758-6155
765 Route 13
Cortland, NY 13045

Cortlandvillesandgravel1@yahoo.com

Dana Fuller
FULLERSLLC@AOL.COM

Christopher Henry

Robert VanCoughnett
rvancoughnett@cranesville.com

Allan Curtis
allanecurtis@yahoo.com

dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

Peter E. Fiorini, Jr.
pefiorini@stny.rr.com

Roger Hutchinson

Don McEvoy

CRUSHED STONE
(price per ton)

Company Contact Person

Valerie Darling
rmsgravel@yahoo.com

mailto:Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com
mailto:Cortlandvillesandgravel1@yahoo.com
mailto:FULLERSLLC@AOL.COM
mailto:rvancoughnett@cranesville.com
mailto:allanecurtis@yahoo.com
mailto:dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
mailto:pefiorini@stny.rr.com
mailto:rmsgravel@yahoo.com
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100% ULS Diesel 15 PPM Fuel
rack price per gallon (Syracuse OPD) 2/1/2019 1.9790

lust plis oil spill liablility trust fund fees per gallon 0.0010
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon 0.0329

TOTAL $2.0129 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.000000

ULS Diesel 15PPM Winterized or With Cold Flow Improver
rack price per gallon (Syracuse OPD) 2/1/2019 1.9790

lust plis oil spill liablility trust fund fees per gallon 0.0010
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon 0.0629

TOTAL $2.0429 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.000000

ULS 15PPM Kerosene
rack price per gallon (Albany OPD) 2/1/2019 2.1842

lust plis oil spill liablility trust fund fees per gallon 0.0010
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon 0.0792

TOTAL $2.2644 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.000000

Company Phone Fax Contact Person

Mirabito Energy Products 607-352-2958 607-352-2822 Joe D'Esti
The Metro Center joe.desti@mirabito.com
49 Court St.
Binghamton NY 13902

ULS DIESEL 15PPM FUEL
(price per gallon)

Item Mirabito 

mailto:joe.desti@mirabito.com


Page 7

$39.95 $40.50 $55.00

Plant Location(s) Phone Fax

F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. Oxford, NY 607-687-1114 607-687-1856
3430 State Rte. 434 Birchardville, PA
Apalachin, NY  13732

Hanson Aggregates NY LLC Jamesville 315-469-3217 315-469-3940
PO Box A Skaneateles
Nedrow, NY 13120

T. H. Kinsella Solvay Rd 315-637-3390 315-637-1808
PO Box 7 Jamesville
Fayetteville, NY 13066

HEAVY ROCK RIP-RAP
(price per ton)

Hanson 
Aggregates KinsellaF.S. Lopke

Allan Curtis
allanecurtis@yahoo.com

Company Contact Person

Roger Hutchinson
Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com

Peter E. Fiorini, Jr.
pefiorini@fslopke.com

mailto:allanecurtis@yahoo.com
mailto:Roger.Hutchinson@Hanson.com
mailto:pefiorini@stny.rr.com
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TITEM No. 203.5 203.7 203.21 304.12 605.1001 610.1403 N/A N/A N/A

SELECT SELECT SELECT SUBBASE COURSE UNDERDRAIN 1-1/4" Minus 

Supplier BORROW GRANULAR FILL STRUCTURE FILL TYPE 2 FILTER TYPE II TOPSOIL Crushed Screened Crusher Run

RMS $4.25 $6.90 $6.90 no bid $13.00 no bid $6.90 $6.90 no bid
Suit-Kote no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $7.00 $7.00 $6.00

Fuller's Excav. $3.00 $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 $12.00 $20.00 $6.00 $3.00 $9.00
F.S. Lopke no bid $6.50 $6.50 $7.00 no bid no bid $7.00 $7.00 $7.00

Hanson no bid $8.00 $8.00 $9.50 $16.00 no bid $8.50 no bid $9.50
Cranesville $6.25 $6.50 $6.50 no bid no bid no bid $9.00 $12.25 $9.00

Cortlandville $4.25 $4.25 $5.25 no bid $10.25 $15.00 $5.00 $4.75 $11.00
T&C Mobile no bid no bid no bid $6.50 no bid no bid $6.50 $4.50 $7.00

Kinsella $5.75 $5.75 $5.75 $16.75 $12.25 $25.00 $7.75 $6.75 $7.75

Plant Location(s) Phone Fax

RMS Gravel Inc. Dryden 844-8196 844-3752
PO Box 455
Dryden. NY 13053

Suit-Kote Corp. Polkville 753-1100 758-0760
1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. 745-2040 315-238-7110
Cortland, NY 13045

F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. Whitney Point 607-687-1114 607-687-1856
3430 State Rte. 434 Oxford
Apalachin, NY  13732

Hanson Aggregates NY LLC Jamesville 315-469-3217 315-469-3940
PO Box A Skaneateles
Nedrow, NY 13120 South Onondaga

Cranesville Aggregate Co. RTE 11A 315-408-4449 315-773-4512
1250 Riverfront Center Tully, NY
Amsterdam, NY 12010

Cortlandville Sand & Gravel South Cortland 607-756-2115 607-758-6155
765 Route 13
Cortland, NY 13045

T&C Mobile Home & Willet 607-343-6852 Troy Donnelly
Construction Services
PO Box 108
Whitney Point, NY 13862

T.H. Kinsella, Inc. Delphi Falls 315-637-3390 315-637-1808 Allan Curtis
PO Box 7 Homer allanecurtis@yahoo.com
Fayetteville, NY 13066

Fuller's Excavation, LLC Cincinnatus, NY 607-745-6665 n/a Dana Fuller
fullersllc@aol.com

Cortlandvillesandgravel1@yahoo.com

tcdonn@frontiernet.net

Christopher Henry

Roger Hutchinson
Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com

Robert VanCoughnett
rvancoughnett@cranesville.com

pefiorini@fslopke.com

rmsgravel@yahoo.com

Don McEvoy
dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

Peter E. Fiorini, Jr.

Valerie Darling

HIGHWAY AGGREGATES
(price per ton)

Company Contact Person

mailto:allanecurtis@yahoo.com
mailto:fullersllc@aol.com
mailto:Cortlandvillesandgravel1@yahoo.com
mailto:tcdonn@frontiernet.net
mailto:Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com
mailto:rvancoughnett@cranesville.com
mailto:pefiorini@fslopke.com
mailto:rmsgravel@yahoo.com
mailto:dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
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Guiderail Post Installation p/hr $140.00 $245.00
Mobilization $450.00 $200.00

Company Phone Fax Contact Person

Silverline Construction, Inc. 607-546-8289 607-546-2828 David Kelly
4299 Newtown Road
Burdett, NY 14818

Chemung Supply Corp
PO Box 527 607-733-5506 607-732-5379 Gerald Wilbur
Elmira, NY 14902

INSTALLATION OF GUIDERAIL POSTS

Silverline 
Construction Chemung Supply
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Centerline $335.00 $339.00 $309.00
Edgeline $195.00 $198.00 $185.00

Stop Bars (each) $75.00 $99.00 $25.00
Yellow Paint (per gal)
White Paint (per gal)
Glass Beads (per lb)

Centerline Miles = 195 (est.) $65,325.00 $66,105.00 $60,255.00
Edgeline Miles = 147(est) $28,665.00 $29,106.00 $27,195.00

Stop Bars=90 est $6,750.00 $8,910.00 $2,250.00
Total Estimated County Cost $100,740.00 $104,121.00 $89,700.00

Centerline $365.00 $339.00 $191.00
Edgeline $225.00 $198.00 $316.00

Yellow Paint (per gal)
White Paint (per gal)
Glass Beads (per lb)

Centerline Miles = 32 (est.) $11,680.00 $10,848.00 $6,112.00
Edgeline Miles = 23 (est) $5,175.00 $4,554.00 $7,268.00

Total Est. Town & Vill. Cost $16,855.00 $15,402.00 $13,380.00

Phone Fax Contact Person

Seneca Pavement Marking, Inc. 607-742-8072 607-846-3347 Matthew Sena
3526 Watkins Road msenecapaving@yahoo.com
Horseheads, NY 14845

Accent Stripe, Inc. 716-823-7704 716-826-2085 Edward Spiesz
3275 N. Benzing Road Eds@Accentstripe.com
Orchard Park, NY 14127

O.H. Striping, Inc.
11016 River Road 607-377-9343 607-377-9343 Jeffrey Bly
Corning, NY 14830 o.h.striping@gmail.com

Town & Village Highways Seneca 
Pavement Accent Stripe

Company

PAINTING TRAFFIC LINES ON CORTLAND COUNTY HIGHWAYS
(price per mile unless noted)

Cortland County Highways Seneca 
Pavement Accent Stripe O.H.Striping, Inc**

O.H.Striping, Inc

** O.H. Striping, Inc. does not meet Cortland County's Qualifications

mailto:msenecapaving@yahoo.com
mailto:o.h.striping@gmail.com
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1) Price per Square Yard
under 5,000 s.y. (@ 1" to 3” depth)

     Price per Square Yard for each 
     additional inch over 3” depth
2) Price per Square Yard

under 5,000-10,000 s.y. (@ 1" to 3” depth)
     Price per Square Yard for each 
     additional inch over 3” depth
3) Price per Square Yard

under 10,000 s.y. (@ 1" to 3” depth)
     Price per Square Yard for each 
     additional inch over 3” depth
4) Price per day for Bituminous Paver

          (Option A only)
6) Price per day

Ingersol – Rand Model DD-110
compaction roller, or equal

             (Option A only)
6A)  Price per day
       Caterpillar Model PS300B
       pneumatic tired roller, or equal
            (Option A only)
6B)   Price per day for Pugmill 
            (Option A only)
7) MS-1 per gallon
           (meeting attached spec.)
8) MS-1P per gallon
           (meeting attached spec.)
9) HFMS-2 per gallon
           (meeting attached spec.)
10) HFMS-2P per gallon
           (meeting attached spec.)
11) HFRA per gallon
           (meeting attached spec.)
12) Calcium Chloride per gallon
           (Option C only)
12A) Magnesium Chloride Per Gallon 
           (Option C only)
13) Maint and Protection of Traffic per day

(Option B&C only)
14) Provide and Haul req’d aggregate per ton

(Option B&C only)

Company Plant Location(s) Phone Fax Contact Person

Suit-Kote Corp. Cortlandville 607-753-1100 758-0760 Lorraine Titus
1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. 607-745-2040 315-238-7110 ltitus@suit-kote.com
Cortland, NY 13045 Don McEvoy

dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

$1.000 $2.330 $0.740

RECYCLED ASPHALT PAVEMENT

Bid prices listed are extended prices from 2016

OPTION A OPTION B OPTION C

$2.060 $2.650 $2.150

$0.270 $0.250 $0.230

$0.100 $0.130 $0.100

$0.900 $2.160 $0.563

$0.080 $0.050 $0.070

$2,900.00 --------- ---------

$1,900.00 --------- ---------

$1,800.00 --------- ---------

$2,000.00 --------- ---------

$2.100 $2.100 $2.100

$2.220 $2.220 $2.220

$2.200 $2.200 $2.200

$2.400 $2.400 $2.400

$2.390 $2.390 $2.390

--------- $1.110 ---------

--------- $1.040 ---------

--------- $0.300 $0.300

--------- $19.500 $19.500

mailto:ltitus@suit-kote.com
mailto:dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
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$162.00 $175.00
$28.25 $28.25

$15.00 $15.00
no charge w/ recap no charge w/ recap

Company Phone Fax Contact Person

Tallmadge Tire 756-6666 753-7964 Todd Cotterill
50 Groton Ave.
Cortland, NY 13045 TODDTTS@YAHOO.COM

 Nail Hole Repair

Refurbished Rim
Additional Items

RETREADED/RECAPPED TIRES
(price per each)

Tallmadge Tire 
Bandomatic PR 

Tallmadge Tire Continental 
HDR1 Items

Recapped 11R24.5

#1R10 Section Repair (cost incr. w/ size)

mailto:TODDTTS@YAHOO.COM
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Heavy 33.95$           36.00$  34.00$  
Medium 33.95$           36.00$  33.00$  

Light 26.95$           29.00$  29.50$  
Fine 24.95$           27.00$  29.50$  

Plant Location(s) Phone Fax Contact Person

F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. Oxford, NY 607-687-1114 607-687-1856 Peter E. Fiorini, Jr.
3430 State Rte. 434 Birchardville, PA pefiorini@fslopke.com
Apalachin, NY  13732

T. H. Kinsella, Inc Solvay Rd. 315-637-3390 315-637-1808 Allan Curtis
PO Box 7 Jamesville allanecurtis@yahoo.com
Fayetteville, NY 13066

Hanson Aggregates NY LLC Jamesville 315-469-3217 Roger Hutchinson
PO Box A Skaneateles Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com
Nedrow, NY 13120

Company

STONE FILLING MATERIALS
(price per ton)

Stone Filling 
Sizes F.S. Lopke Kinsella Hanson 

Aggregates

mailto:pefiorini@stny.rr.com
mailto:allanecurtis@yahoo.com
mailto:Roger.Hutchinson@Hanson.com
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General RD
11RX24.5

05211060000

GENERAL HDR2
11RX24.5

5220430000 $390.00

General Grabber OA
425/65RX22.5

5350120000 $510.00

SUMITOMO
425/65RX22.5

ST520 5531993 $508.44

SUMITOMO
11RX24.5

ST909 5531859 $349.80

$20.00
$10.00
$65.00
$28.25

Company Phone Fax Contact Person

Tallmadge Tire 756-7559 753-3223 TODD COTTERILL
50 Groton Ave. TODDTTD@YAHOO.COM
Cortland, NY 13045

Price
Tread Depth

Vendor Part #

Vendor Part #
Tread Depth

NEW TIRES & TIRE RELATED SERVICES
(price per each)

*No cost to PU used mounted tires

*Standard labor rate for mobile service is from 7:30am - 5:30pm
*Emergency road service is subject to added fee for night time and mileage charges

Price

Tire Brand

Tire Brand
Size

Price

     Refurbished Rim

Size
Price

Items / Information Tallmadge Tire  

     Mobile Service (per hour)

Tread Depth
Vendor Part #

Tire Brand
Size

Services:
     Mount/Dismount
     Fee for Disposal

Tire Brand
Size

Tread Depth
Vendor Part #

Tire Brand
Size

Price
Tread Depth

Vendor Part #

mailto:TODDTTD@YAHOO.COM
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Transit Mix Concrete: (CY unless noted)

Class A $112.00 $113.00 $134.55
Class D $120.00 $121.00 $144.25
Class E $117.00 $118.00 $141.20
Class F $118.00 $119.00 $143.90
Class G $118.00 $119.00 $144.25
Class H $125.00 $126.00 $142.35

Class HP $153.00 $154.00 $180.75
Class DP $153.00 $154.00 $184.75

3000 PSI Flowable Grout $116.00 $117.00 $126.80
Additional charge for loads 

under 4 CY (per load) $75.00 $60.00 $75.00
Wait Time after 30 min. (per 

hour) $90.00 $75.00 $100.00

Precast Concrete Blocks: (EA)

2'x2'x8' N/B $110.00 $85.00
2'x2'x6' N/B $75.00 N/B
2'x2'x4' N/B $60.00 $75.00
2'x2'x3' N/B $60.00 N/B

3'x3'x3' Guide Rail Anchor 
(County to Supply Hardware) N/B $90.00 N/B

2'x2'x8' N/B $110.00 N/B
2'x2'x6' $50.00 $75.00 N/B
2'x2'x4' N/B $60.00 N/B
2'x2'x3' N/B $60.00 N/B

2'x2'x8' N/B $50.00 N/B
2'x2'x6' $50.00 $45.00 N/B
2'x2'x4' N/B $40.00 NB

Company Plant Location(s) Phone Fax Contact Person

Cranesville Block Co., Inc. Syracuse 315-408-4449 315-773-4512 Robert VanCoughnett
1250 Riverfront Center rvancoughnett@cranesville.com
Amsterdam, NY 12010

Vitale Ready Mix Concrete, Inc. Groton 315-252-7227 315-252-7595 Steve Avery
3486 Franklin St. Road Jamesville savery@vitale-robinson.com
Auburn, NY 13021

Hanson Aggregates NY LLC Cortland 315-469-3217 315-469-3940 Roger Hutchinson
PO Box A Marcellus Roger.Hutchinson@LehighHanson.com
Nedrow, NY 13120 Ithaca

Nedrow

Keyway Top Cranesville 
Block Co., Inc Vitale Ready Mix

Waste Blocks Cranesville 
Block Co., Inc Vitale Ready Mix

Hanson Aggregate

Hanson Aggregate

TRANSIT MIX CONCRETE & PRECAST CONCRETE BLOCKS

Concrete Mix Cranesville 
Block Co., Inc Vitale Ready Mix

Smooth Top Cranesville 
Block Co., Inc Vitale Ready Mix

Hanson Aggregate

Hanson Aggregate

mailto:rvancoughnett@cranesville.com
mailto:savery@vitale-robinson.com
mailto:Roger.Hutchinson@Hanson.com
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Full Day $1,800.00
Half Day $1,000.00
Per Hour $275.00

Stump Grinding - per 
inch with 1 man $3.05

Company Phone Fax Contact Person

Carter's Tree Service Rick
3 West Road 607-423-2753 ericaprindle@yahoo.com
Cortland, NY 13045

TREE & STUMP REMOVAL SERVICE

Tree Removal CARTER'S TREE SERVICE

mailto:ericapridle@yahoo.com
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rack price per gallon 2/1/2019 1.4775
lust plus oil spill liablility trust fund fees per gallon 0.0010

firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon 0.0538
TOTAL $1.5323 $0.000000 0.00000 0.0000

Company Phone Fax Contact Person

Mirabito Energy Products 607-352-2958 607-352-2822 Joe D'Esti
The Metro Center
49 Court St. joe.desti@mirabito.com
Binghamton NY 13902

UNLEADED GASOLINE - REGULAR/ETHANOL (87 OCTANE)
(price per gallon)

Item Mirabito

mailto:joe.desti@mirabito.com
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