

COMPARISON LIST
MATERIAL & SERVICE BIDS
2023

INDEX

Page	Title
1	Abrasives for Snow and Ice Control
2	Bituminous Materials - Liquid - <i>Extended Bid Prices (5% increase)</i>
3	Bituminous Concrete
4	Crack Filling - <i>Extended Bid Prices (5% increase)</i>
5	Crushed Stone
6	ULS Diesel 15PPM Fuel
7	Heavy Rock Rip Rap
8	Highway Aggregates
9	Painting Traffic Lines on Cortland County Highways
10	Recycled Asphalt Pavement - <i>Extended Bid Prices (5% increase)</i>
11	Stone Filling Materials
12	Transit Mix Concrete & Precast Blocks
13	Unleaded Gasoline - Regular/Ethanol (87 Octane)

ABRASIVES FOR SNOW & ICE CONTROL

(price per ton)

Company	Bid
F.S. Lopke	\$13.00
Suit-Kote	\$15.25
T. H. Kinsella	\$11.95
Heidelberg Materials Northeast	\$12.30
Syracuse Sand & Gravel LLC	\$17.75
T&C Stone and Gravel	\$9.50
Tri-City Highway Products, Inc.	\$16.00

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	McGraw	607-745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Owego Lounsberry	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Manda Rumola mrumola@fslopke.com
Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY, LLC 5126 S. Onondaga Road Nedrow, NY 13120	Oakwood	315-857-7484	315-469-3133	Tony Barletta Tony.Barletta@lehighhanson.com
T. H. Kinsella, Inc. P.O. Box 7 Fayetteville, NY 13066	Delphi Falls	315-637-3390	315-637-1808	Allan Curtis allanecurtis@yahoo.com
Syracuse Sand & Gravel LLC 6136 East Taft Road North Syracuse, NY	Fulton	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Richard Riccelli richard.riccelli@riccellienterprises.com
T&C Stone & Gravel PO Box 108 Whitney Point, NY 13862	Lisle	607-343-6852	N/A	Troy Donnelly tcdonn@frontiernet.net
Tri-City Highway Products, Inc. 145 Podpadic Road Richmondville, NY 12149	Brisben	518-294-9964	518-294-9951	Martin A. Galasso, Jr. martyjr@lancdev.com

BITUMINOUS MATERIALS - LIQUID

(price per gal unless noted)

***EXTENDED FROM 2022 BID WITH 5% INCREASE**

Bituminous Material	Suit-Kote*
HFRS-2	\$1.813
TACK COAT	\$6.891
HFMS-2	\$2.249
AEP-M	\$1.709
AEDC	\$1.654
AEFC	\$1.599
HFMS-2ST	\$2.172
HFMS-2C	N/B
HFMS-2GH	\$2.636
HFMS-1	\$2.183
HFRS-2P	\$2.227
HFMS-1P	\$2.415
HFMS-2P	\$2.514

Equipment (with Operator)	Suit-Kote*
Distributor	No Charge
Roller (W/operator) (per day)	\$1,764.00
Pneumatic Roller (W/operator) (Per day)	\$1,626.19
Roller (W/O operator) (per day)	\$1,653.75
Pneumatic Roller (W/O operator) (Per day)	\$1,515.94
Chipper (per day)	\$1,708.88
Flow Boy (per hour)	\$143.33
Ten Wheel Dump Truck (per hour)	\$121.28

Company	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	(607) 745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

BITUMINOUS CONCRETE

(price per ton unless noted)

Bituminous Material	Suit-Kote	Heidelberg Materials	Northern Asphalt	Vestal Asphalt Inc	Chenango Concrete Corporation	Tri-City Highway Products, Inc
402.3789 37.5 mm Base Course	\$63.45	\$82.00	\$64.00	No Bid	\$86.67	\$64.00
402.1989 19 mm Binder Course	\$67.68	\$87.25	\$67.00	No Bid	\$90.42	\$68.00
402.2589 25 mm Binder Course	\$65.65	\$86.50	\$65.00	No Bid	\$87.21	\$66.00
402.1283 12.5 mm Top Course	\$74.85	\$90.00	\$74.00	No Bid	\$90.95	\$72.00
402.0983 9.5 mm Top Course	\$77.84	\$97.75	\$78.00	No Bid	\$96.84	\$79.00
402.0683 6.3 mm Top Course (w/ polymer)	\$86.84	\$101.50	\$95.00	No Bid	\$98.17	\$85.00
403.15 Type 5 Shim	\$88.78	\$103.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$98.98	\$90.00
Multi-Grade Modified Asphalt for use in place of Standard asphalt in above conventional HMA items	\$22.60	No Bid	\$12.00	No Bid	\$12.00	\$12.00
15403.2010 Plant Mixed Stockpile Patching Material	\$97.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$125.00	No Bid	No Bid
15403.2020 Cold Mix Stockpile Patching Material	\$92.05	\$105.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15403.2030 Modified Stockpile Patching Material	\$110.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$145.00	No Bid	No Bid
405.0101 Type 1 Cold Mix (Fine mix w/ HFMS-2C)	\$65.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
406.19 7CF Top (High Friction)	\$69.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
406.13 Dense Graded Cold Mix Type 3C Binder Course	\$62.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18403.376	\$67.45	\$82.00	\$64.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18403.256	\$69.65	\$86.50	\$65.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18403.126	\$78.85	\$90.00	\$74.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18403.956	\$81.84	\$97.75	\$78.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Modified Asphalt Hot Sand	\$99.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pretreated Sand	\$48.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Equipment / Service	Suit-Kote	Hanson	Northern Asphalt	Vestal Asphalt Inc	Chenango Concrete Corporation	Tri-City Highway Products, Inc
Paver w/ automated screed & 2 operators	\$3,500.00	No Bid	\$3,800.00	\$4,500.00	No Bid	No Bid
Compaction Roller (w/ operator)	\$2,000.00	No Bid	\$1,800.00	\$2,750.00	No Bid	No Bid
Ten Wheel Dump Truck (per hour)	\$145.00	No Bid	\$160.00	\$200.00	No Bid	No Bid
Flow Boy (per hour)	\$172.50	No Bid	\$200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Trucking of Materials (per ton/mile)	\$0.46	No Bid	\$0.50	\$0.80	No Bid	No Bid

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Loring's Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	Cortlandville	607-745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY, LLC 5126 South Onondaga Road Nedrow, NY 13120	Skaneateles	315-857-7484	315-469-3133	Tony Barletta Tony.Barletta@heidelbergmaterials.com
Northern Asphalt, LLC 6131 East Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Syracuse	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Seth Williams seth.williams@riccellienterprises.com
Vestal Asphalt, Inc. 201 Stage Road Vestal, NY 13850	Vestal	(607) 785-3393	(607) 785-3396	Jim Unkel contracts@vestal-asphalt.com
Tri-City Highway Products 145 Podpadic Road Richmondville, NY 12149	Binghamton	518-294-9964	518-294-9951	Martin Galasso martyjr@lanudev.com
Chenango Concrete Corporation 145 Podpadic Road Richmondville, NY 12149	Norwich	518-294-9964	518-294-9951	Martin Galasso martyjr@lanudev.com

CRACK FILLING

(price gal/day)

***EXTENDED FROM 2022 BID WITH 5% INCREASE**

Crack Fill	Suit-Kote*
0 - 300 gal	\$17.86
301 - 600 gal	\$13.18
601 - 1000 gal	\$11.80
1001 gal +	\$10.31

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	Cortlandville	607-745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

CRUSHED STONE

(price per ton)

Supplier	#1ST	#1A	#1	#2	#3	#1 & #1A Mix	#1 & #2 Mix
Suit-Kote	\$23.00	\$24.75	\$20.50	\$20.50	No Bid	\$23.50	\$21.00
F.S. Lopke	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$20.50	\$20.50	\$21.25	\$22.00	\$21.25
Heidelberg	\$21.00	\$21.75	\$19.25	\$19.25	\$19.25	\$22.25	\$19.75
T.H. Kinsella	\$17.75	\$18.75	\$17.75	\$17.75	\$17.75	\$18.75	\$17.75
Fuller's	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$12.00	No Bid	\$12.00
Tri- City	No Bid	\$22.00	\$21.00	\$21.00	No Bid	\$24.00	\$23.00
Syracuse S & G	No Bid	\$26.00	\$17.50	\$15.00	\$17.50	\$26.00	\$16.00
T & C Stone	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.00	\$18.00	\$15.00	\$24.00	\$22.00

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Fuller's Excavation LLC PO Box 182 Cincinnatus, NY 13040	Cincinnatus	607-745-6665	N/A	Dana Fuller FullersLLC@aol.com
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	Polkville	607-745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Owego	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Manda Rumola mrumola@fslopke.com
Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY, LLC 5126 South Onondaga Road Nedrow, NY 13120	Jamesville Skaneateles	315-857-7484	315-469-3133	Tony Barletta Tony.Barletta@heidelbergmaterials.com
T. H. Kinsella PO Box 7 Fayetteville, NY 13066	Fayetteville Jamesville	315-637-3390	315-637-1808	Allan Curtis allanecurtis@yahoo.com
T&C Stone & Gravel PO Box 108 Whitney Point, NY 13862	Lisle	607-343-6852	N/A	Troy Donnelly tcdonn@frontier.net
Tri-City Highway Products, Inc. 145 Podpadic Road Richmondville, NY 12149	Brisben	518-294-9964	518-294-9951	Martin Galasso martyjr@lancdev.com
Syracuse Sand & Gravel LLC 6131 East Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Munnsville	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Richard Riccelli richard.riccelli@riccellenterprises.com

ULS DIESEL 15PPM FUEL
(price per gallon)

Item	Mirabito	Petroleum Traders Corp.
100% ULS Diesel 15 PPM Fuel		
rack price per gallon (Syracuse OPD) 2/1/2020	3.3850	3.3850
lust plis oil spill liability trust fund fees per gallon	0.0010	0.00314
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon	0.0540	0.1224
TOTAL	\$3.4400	\$3.5105
ULS Diesel 15PPM Winterized or With Cold Flow Improver		
rack price per gallon (Syracuse OPD) 2/1/2020	3.3850	3.3850
lust plis oil spill liability trust fund fees per gallon	0.0010	0.00314
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon	0.0800	0.1424
TOTAL	\$3.4660	\$3.5305
ULS 15PPM Kerosene		
rack price per gallon (Albany OPD) 2/1/2020	5.5200	5.5200
lust plis oil spill liability trust fund fees per gallon	0.0010	0.00314
firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon	0.0800	0.2224
TOTAL	\$5.6010	\$5.7455

Company	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Mirabito Energy Products The Metrocenter 49 Court St. PO Box 5306 Binghamton NY 13902	607-352-2800	607-584-5134	Joe D'Esti joe.desti@mirabito.com
Petroleum Traders Corporation PO Box 2357 Fort Wayne, IN 46801-2357	(888) 637-7661	(260) 203-3820	Joseph Vanderpool Jvanderpool@petroleumtraders.com

HEAVY ROCK RIP-RAP
(price per ton)

F.S. Lopke	Heidelberg Materials	T.H. Kinsella	Syracuse Sand & Gravel LLC
\$62.00	\$85.00	\$72.75	\$48.50

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Oxford, NY	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Manda Rumola mrumola@fslopke.com
Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY, LLC 5126 South Onondaga Road Nedrow, NY 13120	Jamesville Skaneateles	315-857-7484	315-469-3133	Tony Barletta Tony.Barletta@heidelbergmaterials.com
T. H. Kinsella PO Box 7 Fayetteville, NY 13066	Jamesville	315-637-3390	315-637-1808	Allan Curtis allanecurtis@yahoo.com
Syracuse Sand & Gravel LLC 6131 East Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Munnsville	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Richard Riccelli richard.riccelli@riccellienterprises.com

HIGHWAY AGGREGATES

(price per ton)

ITEM No.	203.5	203.7	203.21	304.12	605.1001	610.1403	N/A	N/A	N/A
Supplier	SELECT BORROW	SELECT GRANULAR FILL	SELECT STRUCTURE FILL	SUBBASE COURSE TYPE 2	UNDERDRAIN FILTER TYPE II	TOPSOIL	2" Minus Crushed	2" Minus Screened	2" Minus Crusher Run
Suit-Kote	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$15.00
Fuller's Excav.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.00	\$10.00	\$5.00	\$12.00
F.S. Lopke	\$7.50	\$7.50	\$7.50	\$7.50	\$23.00	\$35.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Heidelberg	No Bid	\$11.15	\$11.15	\$12.60	\$21.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.60
T&C Mobile	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$16.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$10.00	\$7.00	\$12.00
Kinsella	\$9.15	\$9.15	\$9.15	\$11.00	\$14.70	\$28.45	\$10.35	\$9.15	\$10.35
Syracuse Sand & Gravel	\$5.00	\$7.50	\$7.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.50	\$7.50	No Bid
Tri-City Highway Products	\$6.00	\$8.00	\$8.00	No Bid	\$21.00	\$45.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$16.00

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	Polkville	607-745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Nichols Oxford	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Manda Rumola mrumola@fslopke.com
Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY, LLC. 5126 South Onondaga Road Nedrow, NY 13120	Jamesville Skaneateles Oakwood	315-857-7484	315-469-3133	Tony Barletta Tony.Barletta@heidelbergmaterials.com
T&C Stone & Gravel PO Box 108 Whitney Point, NY 13862	Willet	607-343-6852	N/A	Troy Donnelly tcdonn@frontiernet.net
T.H. Kinsella, Inc. PO Box 7 Fayetteville, NY 13066	Jamesville Fayetteville Delphi Falls	315-637-3390	315-637-1808	Allan Curtis allanecurtis@yahoo.com
Syracuse Sand & Gravel LLC 6131 East Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Norwich	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Richard Riccelli richard.riccelli@riccellenterprises.com
Tri-City Highway Products, Inc. 145 Podpadic Road Richmondville, NY 12149	Brisben	518-294-9964	518-294-9951	Martin Galasso martyjr@lancdev.com
Fuller's Excavation LLC PO Box 182 Cincinnatus, NY 13040	Cincinnatus	607-745-6665	N/A	Dana Fuller FullersLLC@aol.com

PAINTING TRAFFIC LINES ON CORTLAND COUNTY HIGHWAYS

(price per mile unless noted)

Cortland County Highways	Seneca Pavement
Centerline	\$469.00
Edgeline	\$309.00
Stop Bars (each)	\$86.00

Centerline Miles = 195 (est.)	\$91,455.00
Edgeline Miles = 153(est)	\$47,277.00
Stop Bars=90 est	\$7,740.00
Total Estimated County Cost	\$146,472.00

Town & Village Highways	Seneca Pavement
Centerline	\$499.00
Edgeline	\$339.00

Centerline Miles = 34 (est.)	\$16,966.00
Edgeline Miles = 24 (est)	\$8,136.00
Total Est. Town & Vill. Cost	\$25,102.00

Company	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Seneca Pavement Marking, Inc. 3526 Watkins Road Horseheads, NY 14845	607-742-8158	607-846-3347	Matthew Sena msenecapave@yahoo.com

RECYCLED ASPHALT PAVEMENT

***EXTENDED FROM 2022 BID WITH 5% INCREASE**

	OPTION A*	OPTION B*	OPTION C*
1) Price per Square Yard under 5,000 s.y. (@ 1" to 3" depth)	\$2.342	\$2.982	\$2.153
Price per Square Yard for each additional inch over 3" depth	\$0.294	\$0.231	\$0.168
2) Price per Square Yard under 5,000-10,000 s.y. (@ 1" to 3" depth)	\$1.103	\$2.625	\$0.830
Price per Square Yard for each additional inch over 3" depth	\$0.116	\$0.147	\$0.074
3) Price per Square Yard under 10,000 s.y. (@ 1" to 3" depth)	\$1.012	\$2.489	\$0.651
Price per Square Yard for each additional inch over 3" depth	\$0.063	\$0.053	\$0.053
4) Price per day for Bituminous Paver (Option A only)	\$3,307.50	-----	-----
6) Price per day Ingersol – Rand Model DD-110 compaction roller, or equal (Option A only)	\$2,205.00	-----	-----
6A) Price per day Caterpillar Model PS300B pneumatic tired roller, or equal (Option A only)	\$2,094.75	-----	-----
6B) Price per day for Pugmill (Option A only)	\$2,315.25	-----	-----
7) MS-1 per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.300	\$2.300	-----
8) MS-1P per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.436	\$2.436	-----
9) HFMS-2 per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.373	\$2.373	-----
10) HFMS-2P per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.594	\$2.594	-----
11) HFRA per gallon (meeting attached spec.)	\$2.583	\$2.583	-----
12) Calcium Chloride per gallon (Option C only)	-----	-----	\$1.491
12A) Magnesium Chloride Per Gallon (Option C only)	-----	-----	No Bid
13) Maint and Protection of Traffic per day (Option B&C only)	-----	\$0.336	\$0.336
14) Provide and Haul req'd aggregate per ton (Option B&C only)	-----	\$23.153	\$23.153

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Suit-Kote Corp. 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd. Cortland, NY 13045	Cortlandville	607-745-2040	315-238-7110	Don McEvoy dmcevoy@suit-kote.com

STONE FILLING MATERIALS

(price per ton)

Stone Filling Sizes	F.S. Lopke	T.H. Kinsella	Heidelberg Materials Northeast	Syracuse Sand & Gravel LLC
Heavy	\$48.50	\$25.00	\$57.00	\$40.75
Medium	\$48.50	\$20.75	\$56.00	\$39.75
Light	\$38.50	\$20.75	\$48.50	\$30.75
Fine	\$37.50	\$18.75	\$48.50	\$30.75

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
F.S. Lopke Contracting Inc. 3430 State Rte. 434 Apalachin, NY 13732	Oxford, NY	607-687-1114	607-687-1856	Manda Rumola mrumola@fslopke.com
T. H. Kinsella, Inc PO Box 7 Fayetteville, NY 13066	Jamesville	315-637-3390	315-637-1808	Allan Curtis allanecurtis@yahoo.com
Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY, LLC. 5126 South Onondaga Road Nedrow, NY 13120	Jamesville	315-857-7484	315-469-3133	Tony Barletta Tony.Barletta@lehighhanson.com
Syracuse Sand & Gravel LLC 6131 East Taft Road North Syracuse, NY 13212	Munnsville	315-433-5115	315-433-1920	Richard Riccelli richard.riccelli@riccellienterprises.com

TRANSIT MIX CONCRETE & PRECAST CONCRETE BLOCKS

Transit Mix Concrete: (CY unless noted)

Concrete Mix	Vitale Ready Mix	Heidelberg Materials
Class A	\$176.00	\$165.00
Class D	\$182.00	\$175.00
Class E	\$172.00	\$172.00
Class F	\$182.00	\$175.00
Class G	\$176.00	\$175.00
Class H	\$176.00	\$175.00
Class HP	\$202.00	\$200.00
Class DP	\$202.00	\$205.00
3000 PSI Flowable Grout	\$171.00	\$160.00
Additional charge for loads under 4 CY (per load)	\$90.00	\$100.00
Wait Time after 30 min. (per hour)	\$60.00	\$90.00

Precast Concrete Blocks: (EA)

Smooth Top	Vitale Ready Mix	Hanson Aggregate
2'x2'x8'	\$280.00	No Bid
2'x2'x6'	\$210.00	No Bid
2'x2'x4'	\$140.00	No Bid
2'x2'x3'	\$105.00	No Bid
3'x3'x3' Guide Rail Anchor (County to Supply Hardware)	No Bid	No Bid

Keyway Top	Vitale Ready Mix	Hanson Aggregate
2'x2'x8'	\$280.00	No Bid
2'x2'x6'	\$210.00	No Bid
2'x2'x4'	\$140.00	No Bid
2'x2'x3'	\$105.00	No Bid

Waste Blocks	Vitale Ready Mix	Hanson Aggregate
2'x2'x8'	\$88.00	No Bid
2'x2'x6'	\$66.00	No Bid
2'x2'x4'	\$44.00	No Bid

Company	Plant Location(s)	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Vitale Ready Mix Concrete, Inc. 3486 Franklin St. Road Auburn, NY 13021	Groton Jamesville Auburn	315-252-7227	315-282-9995	William Rhodes Brhodes@vitalerobinson.com
Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY, LLC. 5126 So. Onondaga Road Nedrow, NY 13120	Cortland Marcellus Ithaca Nedrow	315-374-0036	315-469-3940	Dan Caughey Dan.Caughey@heidelbergmaterials.com

UNLEADED GASOLINE - REGULAR/ETHANOL (87 OCTANE)
(price per gallon)

Item	Mirabito	Petroleum Traders Corp.
Rack price per gallon 2/1/2022	\$2.5496	\$2.5496
Lust plus oil spill liability trust fund fees per gallon	\$0.0010	\$0.0029
Firm price bid for delivery and profit markup per gallon	\$0.0679	\$0.1074
TOTAL	\$2.6185	\$2.6599

Company	Phone	Fax	Contact Person
Mirabito Energy Products The Metrocenter 49 Court St. PO Box 5306 Binghamton NY 13902	607-352-2800	607-584-5134	Joe D'Esti joe.desti@mirabito.com
Petroleum Traders Corporation PO Box 2357 Fort Wayne, IN 46801-2357	(888) 637-7661	(260) 203-3820	Joseph Vanderpool Jvanderpool@petroleumtraders.com